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Today, Tomorrow in Prophec y
By Russell Pollock, Bloomington, General Conventio n

EVERYONE knows that some -
thing big is taking place in the

history of the world. Many of th e
world's intelligent men have looke d
into the future with hope that the
inequitable conditions which now
exist in earth ' s society will soon
give place to a better understand-
ing between peoples and nations .
Many men of high ideals have un-
selfishly devoted years of their
lives in an endeavor to bring about
conditions better than those which
now exist . They hope for a time ,
somewhere in the future, when
this world of ours will not be di-
vided by strife, nor by national in-
terests, but united as one world,
for the common good of all.

At the turn of the century,
Christian nations were assured by
their leaders that within this cen-
tury's swinging portals a golde n
age of peace and good will would
become the heritage of man, be -
cause he had at last learned tha t
war and hate were unable to bring
about peace, the desire for which
still persists and lingers in human
hearts . We are now living in the
last half of the century, and still
wars hare not ceased, nor have
they abated. Rather, during the
last fifty years wars have in-
creased, both in the number of
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people involved and in their powe r
to destroy.

So today, at a time of severe in-
ternational tensions, we hold in our
hands the power to annihilate
every living thing, and we ask our -
selves, what does the future hold?
Does it hold the hope of universa l
peace, or does it hold only fore-
bodings of terrific destruction t o
come because of human folly? Thi s
is an important question for every
thinking person to consider . Where
shall we look to find the answer ?
Can the statesmen of today give us
the answer? I do not think so—
neither do you. Can the Bible an-
swer the question? Can the Word
of God tell us what the future
holds for humanity? I believe that
it can, and that it does. And tha t
is where the study of prophecy
plays a part, that we may be in-
formed of the future purposes o f
the divine plan for man .

About one-third of the Bible is
prophetic. The prophets of the
Bible were inspired teachers . They
foretold many events which have
already come to pass—many that
are now being fulfilled—and many
events which await future fulfil-
ment. So that if we really desire
to know what has happened in the
past in the development of God's



purposes for man, or what is ac-
tually taking place today, or what
the future holds for the human
race, it is incumbent upon us t o
study the prophecies of the Bibl e
that we may be informed .

When we look into the future
through the eyes of prophecy, w e
find that the message of the Bible
is not one of fumbling uncertainty ,
but of definite assurance . Not long
ago, in a meeting of business men ,
one of America's greatest busines s
executives said : "Unfortunately
there is no such thing as a future
certainty ." That sounded good, but
is that statement true? It may b e
true concerning the future of busi-
ness, concerning the gyrations of
the stock market ; concerning the
immediate prospects of peace or
war. But the statement that " there
is no such thing as a future cer-
tainty" is wrong as it concerns
God's future purposes for the hu-
man race. To give us knowledge
of the future is the reason God sent
his prophets, and their power t o
predict was from him. Thus in-
spired they spoke for him as they
announced with assurance and cer-
tainty what the future holds for
humanity .

Second Peter 1 :19-21 says : "We
have also a more sure word of
prophecy ; whereunto ye do wel l
that ye take heed, as unto a light
that shineth in a dark place, unti l
the day dawn, and the day star
arise in your hearts. Knowing this
first, that no prophecy of the scrip-
ture is of any private interpreta-
tion"; that is, it is not merely th e
words of the prophet, "for the
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prophecy came not in old time b y
the will of man: but holy men of
God spake as they were moved by
the Holy Spirit . "

"A light that shineth in a dark
place"—that is the Bible's defini-
tion of prophecy. Descriptive, is it
not? Darkness covers the eart h
today, gross darkness the people .
We are traversing a dangerous
road. But just as a lantern, or a
flashlight, may aid to show us our
path in the dark, so prophecy is a
light shining in this dark world,
showing us the way to proceed, i n
harmony with the expressed will
of God .

In verse 19 of this text we rea d
the expression, "a more sure wor d
of prophecy . " Prophecy is history
written in advance . Only God
could write history like that, tell-
ing what must shortly come t o
pass . And because he has writte n
it, it is sure indeed. And in the
same verse the apostle continues ,
saying, "whereunto ye do well tha t
ye take heed. " Many of the world-
lywise today are not taking heed .
Many are wise today, but wise in
their own conceits, and wisdom ha s
become to them a snare. Jesus
condemned the wise ones of hi s
day for their inability to see the
signs of the times ; and so in our
day, many of the wise according
to this world's wisdom are blind,
and in perplexity and fear of the
future .

And none are more blind to the
great changes which are impending
than the leaders of science and re-
ligion who have not taken heed t o
the sure word of prophecy. Only
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a "fool hath said in his heart,
There is no God." (Ps . 14:1) And
so these blind, wise fools, who
think that they can bring in the
golden age of science, will be dis-
appointed, for the Bible says they
cannot. The child of God, how-
ever, does not fear for the future
because faith in the prophecies o f
God casts out fear through an un-
derstanding of the purposes o f
God. Faith and fear cannot live in
the same heart.

The prophecies to which we do
well to take heed were not under -
stood by those who uttered them ,
for it was not time for them to be
understood . As an example ; Daniel
made a prophecy. He wanted to
understand it, but was told : "The
words are closed up and sealed till
the time of the end." (Dan. 12 :8, 9 )
The Apostle Peter also said that
the prophets inquired and searched
diligently to understand the thing s
which they had spoken as God ' s
mouthpieces, but they could not .
They had been used as servants of
God to lay up treasures of wisdom
and knowledge for us who, today ,
"take heed" to the "sure word of
prophecy," which reveals the pur-
poses of God in the affairs and
events of mankind .

But someone may ask, "How can
we be sure that the prophecies ar e
accurate? " That is a good ques-
tion. Let us look at the prophecie s
which are already fulfilled, as a key .

After the betrayal in Eden, God
said to the serpent (representativ e
of Satan), "I will put enmity be-
tween thee and the woman, and
between thy seed and her seed ; it
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shall bruise thy head, and tho u
shalt bruise his heel ." (Gen. 3 :15 )
This was the first prophecy of a
coming to the world of a Savior
and Redeemer. He was to be not
of the seed of Adam, but the seed
of the woman. Had he been of
Adam's seed, he would have par -
taken of Adam's condemnation,
therefore unable to "redeem his
brother, nor give to God a ransom
for him."—Ps. 49 : 7

But the seed of the woman
pointed forward to Christ, who was
to be born of a virgin. Hundreds
of years before Jesus was born, th e
prophet of God spoke concerning
him, as Isaiah the prophet declared
in chapter 7, verse 14,• "Therefore
the Lord himself shall give you a
sign; Behold, a virgin shall con-
ceive, and bear a son, and shall
call his name Immanuel. " The
seed of the woman, our Lord Jesus
Christ, came in fulfilment of this
prophecy.

Micah 5:2 tells us, "But thou,
Bethlehem Ephratah, though tho u
be little among the thousands o f
Judah, yet out of thee shall h e
come forth unto me that is to be
ruler in Israel; whose goings forth
have been from of old, from ever -
lasting." Bethlehem the beautiful
was to be the place of his birth, ac -
cording to this prophecy, and so i t
was . These are not opinions, these
are facts of history. His virgin
mother ; the village of his birth —
could the infant have shaped the
accomplishment of these predic-
tions made hundreds of years be -
fore ?

But these are only two events—



there are many more. The death
that he should die ; the cup that he
should drink; the sepulchre in
which he should be laid . Could
the man have shaped their accom-
plishment? The length of time h e
spent in the tomb ; his resurrection
from the dead; the sending of th e
Holy Spirit to his disciples at Pen-
tecost—all were predicted ; all were
beyond human collusions, or con-
trivance ; all were accomplished .
Cannot these be recognized as be-
ing by the hand of God? Is not
this evidence of the accuracy of th e
sure Word of prophecy in past per-
formance? That all these prophe-
cies were fulfilled in one life is
sufficient reason for Jew or Gen -
tile to consider the clear implica-
tion that Jesus Christ was the So n
of God .

As the prophecies which applie d
to times past have accurately com e
to pass, so today many prophecies
are being fulfilled . Some of these
refer to the return of the Jewish
people to their homeland. Every-
one knows that this is an event of
modern history . The facts pre-
sented by their return are within
themselves sufficient evidence t o
prove that we are living at a tim e
when the prophecies of the Bible
are even now in course of fulfil-
ment.

The survival of the Jewish peo-
ple at all is itself a rare event in
human history . Many nations be-
sides Israel have lost their inde-
pendence under the heel of their
invaders, but I can think of no
people other than Israel who hav e
been so scattered, and yet have
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been able to preserve their identit y
for centuries, and finally manifes t
a capacity to recuperate . But Is-
rael has accomplished this.

For long centuries Israel has
wandered to the ends of the earth ,
without a homeland, but she never
lost her undying hope to return
some day to the land of Palestine.
This hope, based on great faith,
has been rewarded, and so today
Israel in her homeland is one o f
the political realities of our time;
a wonder to the believers in proph-
ecy and to unbelievers too .

At a time when many stron g
governments have become weak ;
at a time when empires have col -
lapsed ; at a time when conflict and
turmoil have beset existing king-
doms and governments ; Israel has
been reborn . Its birth has arrested
the eyes of the world . Why? Be-
cause everyone knows that th e
prophecies have declared that sh e
would come back. Everyone knows
that "the mouth of the Lord hath
spoken it."

Four thousand years ago the
land of Israel was promised to
Abraham, the Father of the Jew-
ish race. The nation of Israel,
therefore, as it exists today, i s
more, much more, to the student
of the Bible than a historica l
event—it is a prophetic event. No
serious-minded person will lightly
assume that Israel " just happened . "
She overcame too many obstacle s
to have been like Topsy and "just
growed. " Her existence fulfils a
promise made by God long cen-
turies ago, and recorded in Gene-
sis 13 :14, 15, as follows : "And the
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Lord said unto Abram, after that
Lot was separated from him, Lift
up now thine eyes, and look fro m
the place where thou art north -
ward, and southward, and east -
ward, and westward: for all the
land which thou seest, to thee will
I give it, and to thy seed for ever . "

I personally am not a Jew ; but ,
as a student of prophecy, I thrilled
at what I saw in Israel only a few
weeks ago. One million six hun-
dred thousand Jews live in Israel .
Everywhere one senses the pio-
neering spirit that leads to toil and
sacrifice as a wilderness is bein g
transformed at least to a semblance
of the land that formerly over-
flowed with milk and honey.

To the student of prophecy, Is-
rael is not merely a political, but
a religious event. It is a beehive
of activity as the problems of agri-
culture and industry and govern-
ment present themselves for
solution, and we watch with interes t
and hail with joy every token o f
blessing which we see coming to
this people . But now let me rea d
you some prophecies concerning
their return :

Jeremiah 16:14-16 says : "There-
fore, behold, the days come, saith
the Lord, that it shall no more b e
said, The Lord liveth, that brought
up the children of Israel out of th e
land of Egypt; but, The Lord liv-
eth, that brought up the childre n
of Israel from the land of the north,
and from all the lands whither h e
had driven them: and I will bring
them again into their land that I
gave unto their fathers . Behold, I
will send for many fishers, saith
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the Lord, and they shall fish them ;
and after will I send for many
hunters, and they shall hunt them
from every mountain, and from
every hill, and out of the holes of
the rocks . "

And Amos 9:14, 15, says: "And
I will bring again the captivity of
my people of Israel, and they shall
build the waste cities, and inhabit
them; and they shall plant vine-
yards, and drink the wine thereof ;
they shall also make gardens, an d
eat the fruit of them. And I will
plant them upon their land, and
they shall no more be pulled u p
out of their land which I have
given them, saith the Lord th y
God."

And again Jeremiah says in
chapter 32:43 and 44: "And fields
shall be bought in this land, where -
of ye say, It is desolate without
man or beast; it is given into the
hand of the Chaldeans. Men shall
buy fields for money, and subscribe
evidences, and seal them, and
take witnesses in the land of Ben-
jamin, and in the places about
Jerusalem, and in the cities of
Judah, and in the cities of th e
mountains, and in the cities of
the valley, and in the cities of th e
south: for I will cause their cap-
tivity to return, saith the Lord . "

Isaiah tells us in chapter 41 :48 to
20 : "I will open rivers in hig h
places, and fountains in the midst
of the valleys : I will make the wil-
derness a pool of water, and th e
dry land springs of water. I will
plant in the wilderness the cedar,
the shittah tree, and the myrtle ,
and the oil tree; I will set in the



desert the fir tree, and the pine ,
and the box tree together : that
they may see, and know, and con-
sider, and understand together tha t
the hand of the Lord hath done
this, and the Holy One of Israel
hath created it . "

Do these prophecies require fur-
ther comment? If so, my comment
is that I saw in Israel every evi-
dence that these prophecies are
being fulfilled. God 's dealings with
Israel constitute one of the key s
which unlock the prophecies of the
Bible, assisting us to an under -
standing of God's plan for human
redemption and salvation.

We are now living in the closing
days of the Gospel age . Since the
day of Pentecost the great work o f
salvation has been the call and se-
lection of the Gospel church . But
the Bible says that these Christians
who constitute the Christian church
are but a "little flock." Their re-
ward for faithfulness is a heavenl y
one. They will "live and reign
with Christ a thousand years . "

The millennial age is about to
dawn for sin-sick humanity. Dur-
ing the thousand years of Christ's
reign the earthly phase of the
kingdom of God will be establishe d
and "God's will done in earth, as
it is in heaven, " in fulfilment of
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the petition which Jesus taught his
disciples to pray.

During this one-thousand-year
reign, the promises of God will be
fulfilled and all the families of the
earth will be blessed . This will in-
clude both Jew and Gentie, bond
and free, male and female. For
then the "knowledge of the glory
of the Lord will cover the earth as
the waters cover the sea . " For
then all men shall know the Lord .
The prophet says, "And they shall
teach no more every man his
neighbor, and every man his
brother, saying, Know the Lord :
for they shall all know me, from
the least of them unto the greatest
of them, saith the Lord : for I will
forgive their iniquity, and I will
remember their sin no more ."—
Jer . 31 :34

The prophecies which have al-
ready been fulfilled have been
fulfilled with definite accuracy.
And from this fact we know that
the future will see the promises of
the golden age of prophecy brin g
both Jew and Gentile into a full
appreciation of the blessings of
Messiah's kingdom, soon to be
available to all people who will
render willing obedience to th e
righteous rule of Jesus Christ, the
Savior of the world .

"At the Gate
0! we long to see Thy glory streaming wide o'er all the earth ;
Every error, old and hoary, flee to realms that gave them birth .
For this glorious culmination not for long shall Zion wait ;
Soon will come her coronation ; Lo, her King is at the gate!



LESSON FOR SEPTEMBER 4

1i 1i orship Revived in Jerusalem
GOLDEN TEXT : "Then he answered and spoke unto me, saying, This is th e
word of the Lord unto Zerubbabel, saying, Not by might, nor by power ,
but by my Spirit, saith the Lord of hosts ."

	

—Zechariah 4:6

EZRA 3:1, 3, 10, 1 1
HAGGAI 1 :7-9, 14; ZECHARIAH 4 :6-9

THE restoration of facilities in
Jerusalem for use in worship-

ing the God of Israel, including the
rebuilding of the temple, was
largely supervised by Zerubbabel .
His name implies that he was born
in Babylon, and he was the recog-
nized head, or prince, of the tribe
of Judah. Our Golden Text indi-
cates clearly that he was commis-
sioned by the Lord for thi s
important undertaking . This i s
also shown in Ezra 1 :5. He was
reminded that it would not be ac-
complished by mere human migh t
and power, but by the Spirit of th e
Lord .

Before laying the foundations of
the temple, Zerubbabel directe d
that an altar should be built upon
which burnt offerings could be of-
fered to the Lord—"morning and
evening . " They kept the feast of
tabernacles, and observed all the
other "set feasts of the Lord, " "but
the foundation of the temple was
not yet laid . " It was not until the
second month of the second yea r
after arriving in Jerusalem that
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construction work on the founda-
tion for the temple began .—vs . 8

When the foundation was com-
pleted there was a great celebra-
tion by the priests and Levites ,
"and all the people shouted with a
great shout, when they praised the
Lord, because the foundation of
the house of the Lord was laid . "
(vs. 11) But when some who re -
membered the former temple of
Solomon saw the foundation of the
new temple laid, they "wept with a
loud voice; and many shoute d
aloud for joy: so that the people
could not discern the noise of the
shout of joy from the noise of the
weeping of the people."—vss . 12, 13

Haggai 2 :3 indicates that those
who remembered Solomon's tem-
ple felt that the new temple cam e
far short of being as glorious in
appearance, hence the disappoint-
ment displayed in the weeping, as
recorded in Ezra 3 :12, 13 . The new
temple was somewhat larger tha n
the old, but not so rich and lavish
as that provided by Solomon .

In Haggai 2:9 we read that "the
glory of this latter house shall be
greater than of the former, " but
here the prophet is evidently re-
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ferring to the antitypical temple—
Christ and his church in glory, the
coming meeting place between God
and all mankind . This is indicated
by verse six which speaks of a
shaking of the "heavens and the
earth, " which Paul quotes in Heb-
rews 12 :26-28 and applies to thi s
end of the Gospel age and the es-
tablishment of the kingdom of
Christ. This shaking will involv e
"all nations, " and then their de-
sire shall come, and the Lord will
fill "this house with glory ."—Hag.
2 :6-9

After the foundation of the tem-
ple was laid the enemies of the Is-
raelites sought to interfere with
the undertaking ; and they did dis-
courage Zerubbabel, so that noth-
ing further was done for fifteen
years . Then the Lord raised up
two prophets—Haggai and Zecha-
riah—and through their words of
encouragement Zerubabbel wa s
stirred up to resume work on th e
temple .—Ezra 5 :1, 2

Haggai directed, "Go up to the
mountain, and bring wood, and
build the house, and I will tak e
pleasure in it, and I will be glori-
fied, saith the Lord . " (ch. 1:8 )
Verse 9 indicates that the people ,
while neglecting to build the tem-
ple, had provided themselves with
homes, and with this the Lord was
not pleased .

The Lord also encouraged Ze-
rubbabel through the Prophet
Zechariah . He wrote, "The hands
of Zerubbabel have laid the
foundation of the house ; his hands
shall also fmish it; and thou shalt
know that the Lord of hosts hath
sent me unto you." (ch. 4:9) In
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QUESTIONS
Who was Zerubbabel, and what great tas k

did the Lord commission him to perform ?
Why did those who remembered Solomon's

temple weep when the foundation o f
the new temple was laid ?

To what temple does the Prophet Hagga i
refer when he says, "The glory of thi s
latter house shall be greater than of
the former"?

Why was work on the temple stopped, and
what measures did the Lord use to re-
vive it ?

What was the great "mountain" whic h
Zechariah promised would become a
plain before Zerubbabel, and wha t
lesson may be taken from this messag e
of encouragement ?

verse 7 we read, "Who art thou, 0
great mountain? before Zerubbabel
thou shalt become a plain : and he
shall bring forth the headstone
thereof with shoutings, crying ,
Grace, grace, unto it. "

Here a "mountain" is used to il-
lustrate what seemed to Zerub-
babel as insurmountable obstacle s
in the way of finishing the temple.
But the prophet assured him tha t
this "mountain " would become a
plain, and that the temple woul d
be completed and the headstone
laid amidst great rejoicing. And
it was so . The language reminds
us of Jesus' statement to the dis-
ciples concerning a faith great
enough to remove mountains . Our
great adversary, the Devil, makes
small difficulties appear as moun-
tains in order to discourage us .
But as in the case of Zerubbabel ,
these "mountains" will becom e
plains before us if by faith, w e
continue on in the narrow way.



LESSON FOR SEPTEMBER 1 1

Struggle for Survival
GOLDEN TEXT: "Then I told them of the hand of my God which was goo d
upon me; as also the king's words that he had spoken unto me . And they
said, Let us rise up and build. So they strengthened their hands for thi s
good work ."

	

—Nehemiah 2 :1 8

S ZERUBBABEL was commis-
sioned to build the temple i n

Jerusalem, Nehemiah was the one
appointed to rebuild the walls .
Nehemiah was a cupbearer for
King Artaxerxes, of Persia, and
dwelt in the king's palace at Shu-
shan. Hanani, one of his Jewish
brethren, came to Persia from
Jerusalem and visited Nehemiah ,
who asked concerning the welfare
of his people in Judah .

The report was, "The remnant
that are left of the captivity there
in the province are in great afflic-
tion and reproach: the wall of Je-
rusalem also is broken down, an d
the gates thereof are burned with
fire. " (Neh. 1:1-3) Nehemiah wep t
when he received this report, and
prayed earnestly to the Lord, con-
fessing the sins of his people, an d
mentioning a promise the Lor d
made to Moses concerning the
blessing of his people when the y
confessed and forsook their sin s
and turned to him for help.—ch.
1 :5-11

Nehemiah then waited for a
favorable opportunity to present
the matter before the king and re-
quest leave of absence that he
might go to Jerusalem and restore

the walls and the city . The king
agreed, and upon Nehemiah's re-
quest gave him letters of authority
and a requisition to present t o
Asaph, "the keeper of the king's
forest," for timber that might be
needed in the construction project.

Nehemiah then went to Jerusa-
lem. Upon arrival, Sanballat, a
Moabite of Beth-horon who appar-
ently held some position of author-
ity in Samaria at the time, at once
manifested his animosity toward
Nehemiah, as did also his servant ,
Tobiah, the Ammonite. But Ne-
hemiah proceeded with caution ,
making his survey of the city's
walls at night so his enemies would
not know at once the purpose of
his coming .

Having decided upon a course of
action, he then announced the pur-
pose of his visit to those whom he
believed would co-operate with
him. In the words of our Golden
Text they replied, "Let us rise up
and build . " Sanballat and To-
biah mocked, and tried to frighten
Nehemiah out of attempting th e
work, but failed . He reminded
them that they had no jurisdiction
in Jerusalem, and that the "God of
heaven " would prosper the work
of his servants .—ch. 2 :19, 20

Chapter three details the or -

NEHEMIAH 4:6-9, 15, 21-23

f

	

12:27, 43

iL
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ganizational arrangement for the
work of construction, each of the
various leaders of the people being
assigned a section of the wall as
his responsibility. Seeing that the
work was actually in progress,
Sanballat was "wroth," and made
a move to have his Samaritan army
attack and stop the work. But, as
Nehemiah reports, "We made our
prayer unto our God, and set a
watch against them day and night . "
—ch. 4:1, 2, 9

Just as it was by the Spirit of the
Lord that the temple was rebuilt ,
so Nehemiah knew that only b y
the help of the God of Israel could
they hope to build the walls of the
city. His prayer had opened the
way for him to go to Jerusalem to
supervise the work, and now tha t
a crisis had arisen, threatening to
hinder the work, he again took the
matter to the Lord in prayer—"We
made our prayer . "

Then Nehemiah placed guards i n
all vulnerable places, armed with
spears and bows. The enemy,
realizing that their plan had bee n
discovered, hence that a surprise
attack was not possible, held back,
and the work of building was re-
sumed. But Nehemiah ordered
that they should maintain their
watch. Some worked, others stoo d
on guard. In fact, the workers held
a weapon in one hand, and worke d
with the other .

Despite all the handicaps, the
walls of Jerusalem were rebuilt in
fifty-two days. (ch. 6 :15) It re-
veals what can be accomplishe d
when the Lord blesses the efforts
of his faithful people . Then came
the "dedication with gladness, both

11

QUESTION S
Who was Nehemiah, and what work did th e

Lord commission him to do ?
Who were Sanballat and Tobiah ?
What was the most important thing tha t

Nehemiah and his fellow-workers di d
when threatened by their enemies?

How long did it take to rebuild the walls o f
Jerusalem ?

What assurance did the returned captive s
have that they would not be destroyed
by their enemies?

with thanksgivings, and with sing-
ing, with cymbals, psalteries, and
with harps."—ch. 12 :2 7

"Also, " the record states, "that
day they offered great sacrifices
and rejoiced : for God had made
them rejoice with great joy ." (ch .
12:43) Those whom God make s
rejoice are joyful indeed .

As the title of our lesson sug-
gests, the returning captives fro m
Babylon had a real struggle fo r
survival . They were compara-
tively few in number, and n o
match, militarily, for the enemies
which surrounded them on every
side. But they had leaders wh o
were faithful to God, and thi s
meant that they had divine help
and protection, just as the oppo-
site was true when they were
taken out of the land into cap-
tivity . It was now God's will tha t
they remain in the land until thei r
Messiah should come, and with
Jehovah on their side, no weapo n
formed against them could prosper .
The same is true of spiritual Is-
raelites today. We, too, have ene-
mies on every side, but greater is
he who is for us than all who be
against us .



LESSON FOR SEPTEMBER 1 8

Malachi tails for Righteous living
GOLDEN TEXT : "Have we not all one father? hath not one God created us ?
why do we deal treacherously every man against his brother, by profaning
the covenant of our fathers?"

	

—Malachi 2 :1 0

MALACHI 3 :1-6, 13-1 8

'THE name Malachi means, "my'THE
The Prophet Mala-

chi served Israel during the days
of Nehemiah, or, in other words ,
during the reconstruction period
which followed the nation's cap-
tivity in Babylon . The first two
chapters of his prophecy are largely
a denunciation of Israel's wicked-
ness, particularly the corrupt prac-
tices of the priesthood . Under the
strong leadership of Ezra, Nehe-
miah and Zerubbabel, the people
made at least an outward show of
righteousness, but at heart they
seemed little different from what
they were before their captivity in
Babylon.

Not only were they lax in thei r
worship of Jehovah, as manifested ,
for example, in their offering sick
and blemished sacrifices on hi s
altars, but they also lacked prope r
consideration for one another .
"Have we not all one father?"
Malachi asks . (ch. 2 :10) They were
all the children of Abraham t o
whom belonged the promises of
God, yet they dealt " treacherously "
against their brethren . They were
all God's creation, and as a natio n
had made a covenant with him,
yet by their desecration of his
altars, and their treacherous deal -
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ings with one another, they pro-
faned, or broke, that covenant .

The people complained that the y
were not being blessed by God, ye t
they seemed not to realize that
their poverty was due to their un-
faithfulness to the Lord and to th e
covenant which their fathers ha d
made with him . "Ye are curse d
with a curse, " the Lord said to
them, "for ye have robbed me,
even this whole nation . " Then the
Lord added, "Bring ye all the
tithes into the storehouse, that
there may be meat in mine house,
and prove me now herewith, saith
the Lord of hosts, if I will not open
you the windows of heaven, and
pour you out a blessing, that ther e
shall not be room enough to re-
ceive it. "—ch. 3 :8-10

Like the other prophets, in addi-
tion to reprimanding Israel for her
sins, Malachi forecast coming
events in the plan of God. Chapter
3:1 tells of two "messengers" whom
the Lord would send, one to "pre-
pare the way before" the Messiah ,
and the other the Messiah himself ,
who, in this prophecy, is describe d
as the "Messenger of the covenant . "
From Matthew 11:10 we learn tha t
John the Baptist was the first o f
these messengers. By comparing
John the Baptist 's comment con-
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cerning Jesus (Matt. 3:11, 13) with
Malachi 3 :2, 3, it becomes evident
that Jesus is the other Messenger,
the "Messenger of the covenant ."

The covenant referred to is the
one promised in Jeremiah 31 :31-34,
the "New Covenant" which the
Lord here promises to make with
"the house of Israel, and with the
house of Judah. " Jesus is the
"Messenger," the Mediator of that
covenant . John the Baptist 's mis-
sion was to reform the people of
Israel and bring them back int o
harmony with the original Law
Covenant. The failure of this ef-
fort was the fmal test which dem-
onstrated the need for the New
Covenant.

The "Messenger of the Cove-
nant, " Malachi said, would "purify
the sons of Levi, . . . that they may
offer unto the Lord an offering in
righteousness . " Under the old Law
Covenant arrangement the tribe o f
of Levi were the religious servants
of the people, the priests being of
this tribe . Beginning at the first ad-
vent, at which time Israel unde r
the old covenant was rejected ,
there began the work of preparin g
the priestly class to administer the
affairs of the New Covenant . The
calling of these from both Jews and
Gentiles, and their refining an d
purifying and offering of sacrifice ,
has been the work of the Gospe l
age.—Heb . 3:1; I Pet . 2 :5, 9

These will be associate "mes-
sengers" of the New Covenant .
This covenant will become opera-
tive first with Judah, at Jerusalem .
Then as the prophet declares "the
offering of Judah and Jerusalem "
will "be pleasant unto the Lord, as

QUESTION S
When did the Prophet Malachi serve Israel,

and what is the meaning of his name ?
What is the principal subject matter of th e

first two chapters of Malachi's prophecy?
Who are the two messengers referred to i n

Malachi 3 :1 ?
What "covenant" is referred to in this

prophecy ?
What position did the tribe of Levi occup y

in typical Israel, and who are the anti -
typical "Sons of Levi"?

Why has evil triumphed throughout the ages,
and when and how will this situatio n
be changed?

in the days of old, and as in former
years . "

Many throughout the ages have
said that it is "vain to serve the
Lord . " (Malachi 3 :14) It is also
frequently true that "now we cal l
the proud happy; yea, they that
work wickedness are set up ; yea ,
they that tempt God are even de-
livered . " But this will continue to
be true only while the Devil re-
mains the "prince of this world. "
When the New Covenant is inau-
gurated, with Jesus and his joint -
heirs as its "Messengers, " evildoers
will be cut off and the righteous
rewarded .

Meanwhile, those who love th e
Lord and speak often one with th e
other are being noted by him, an d
these will be his precious ones, his
"jewels, " those who will be as a
royal diadem in his hand, to b e
used for the blessing of all Israel,
and also all the families, or nations ,
of the earth. Then there will b e
discernment between the righteous
and the wicked. The righteous will
receive everlasting life, and th e
wicked will be destroyed .
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'Renewed Bilegiance to the law
GOLDEN TEXT : "I am the Lord your God; walk in my statutes, and keep m y
judgments, and do them ."

	

—Ezekiel 20 :19

EHEMIAH supervised the re -
building of the walls of

Jerusalem, and Zerubbabel super -
intended the rebuilding of the tem-
ple, and it was "Ezra the priest"
who "brought the law before the
congregation both of men and
women, and all that could hear
with understanding . " (Neh. 8 :2 )
It must have been a great day i n
Judah when this took place . A
pulpit had been erected upon which
Ezra stood as he read out of th e
book of the Law, as "all the peopl e
gathered . . . into the street that
was before the water gate."—ch.
8 :1, 4 ; 9 :3, 4

"Ezra opened the book in th e
sight of all the people; (for he wa s
above all the people ;) and when
he opened it, all the people stood
up : and Ezra blessed the Lord, th e
great God . And all the people an-
swered, Amen, Amen, with lifting
up their hands ." (vss. 5, 6) Not
only was the Law read to the peopl e
of Israel that day, but Ezra and hi s
assistants "gave the sense, and
caused them to understand the
reading . "—vs . 8

It is a fundamental principle in
God 's dealings with his people that
they understand his will and ways .
God desires that his people worship
him "in Spirit and in truth," that is,

from the heart, and in harmony
with his truth . This is particularly
true of spiritual Israel during th e
Gospel age. Through the Apostl e
Paul 's message to Timothy, he has
admonished these to "study," tha t
they might show themselves "ap-
proved " unto him, "workmen that
needeth not to be ashamed, rightly
dividing the Word of truth. "—
II Tim. 2 :1 5

The old axiom, "It doesn't matter
what one believes as long as h e
lives right, " is not in harmony with
the Word of God. The Bible
teaches that in order to live righ t
it is necessary to believe right.
Jesus prayed on behalf of his fol-
lowers, "Sanctify them through thy
truth, thy Word is truth . "—John
17 :1 7

For the people of Israel to rene w
their allgiance to God' s Law, it was
essential not only that the Law be
read to them, but that they under -
stand "the sense" or meaning of
the Law; and Ezra was faithful in
performing this task . The reading
of the Law continued for seven
days . On the eighth day there was
a final "solemn assembly" as the
Law prescribed .—Neh. 8 :18

It was on the twenty-fourth day
of the same month that the people
came together again, not to feast ,
but to fast "and with sackclothes ,
and earth upon them, " (ch . 9:1 )

EZEKIEL 20 :19, 20
NEHEMIAH 9 :1-3; 10:32, 35, 37, 39
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Again the Law was read to them ,
"one fourth part of the day; and
another fourth part they confessed ,
and worshiped the Lord their God . "
—ch. 9 :3

Then several of the Levites com-
manded the people to "stand up
and bless the Lord," and while they
stood there was an eloquent ora-
tion recounting the goodness and
mercy of the Lord, beginning from
the time he first called Abram in
Ur of the Chaldees, down to the
time of their captivity. In this
oration the punishments of Israel
were regretted, "Howbeit," they
said to the Lord, "thou art just in
all that is brought upon us; for
thou hast done right, but we have
done wickedly. Neither have our
kings, our princes, our priests, nor
our fathers kept thy law, nor
hearkened unto thy command-
ments and thy testimonies, where -
with thou didst testify against
them."—ch. 9:33, 34

"Because of all this," the state-
ment continues," we make a sure
covenant, and write it ; our princes,
Levites, and priests, seal unto it . "
(ch . 9:38) Those who sealed this
covenant are stated in the talmudi c
writings, and unanimously by tra-
dition, to have formed "The Grea t
Synagogue ." It continued for 110
years, from Nehemiah to Simon the
Just. Then it became known as the
Sanhedrin, referred to in the New
Testament.

In this covenant they bound
themselves not to intermarry with
the heathen (ch . 10:30) ; to keep
the sabbath and sabbatical year
(vs . 31) ; to pay one-third of a
shekel annually to the temple and
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QUESTION S
Who was used by the Lord to restore God' s

Law to the returned captives from
Babylon?

Was it important for the Israelites that the y
understand the will of God? Is what
we believe important to know how w e
are to live ?

What were the special points of agreement
contained in the covenant with the Lor d
drawn up by Nehemiah and hi s
associates?

Who signed this covenant ?
What things of importance were omitted

from this covenant?
What did Jesus describe as the "weightie r

matters of the Law"?

its services (vs . 32) ; to supply
wood for the altar (vs. 34) ; and to
pay the priestly dues . (vss. 35-39)
This covenant was largely a re -
affirmation of certain ordinances o f
the Mosaic Law, omitting the grea t
basic requirements of justice an d
good will contained in the Ten Com -
mandments, those referred to b y
Jesus as the "weightier matters o f
the Law, judgment, mercy, an d
faith."—Matt. 23:23

This covenant represented a
noble effort to strengthen the re-
ligious life of the Israelites, even
though it did stress merely certain
ceremonial aspects of the Law. It
was a covenant which men adde d
to the original Book of the Law .

Referring to the ordinances of
the Law, Jesus said they shoul d
not be neglected, but that the
Lord's people should seek to get
the spirit of the whole Law. (Matt .
23 :23) It is so with us today . Every
detail of the Lord's will is impor-
tant.
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The Feast at Bloomingto n
THE General Convention of Bible

Students held in Bloomington ,
Indiana, July 30 to August 5, i s
now but a memory, but a most
blessed memory, one which will
long linger in the hearts and mind s
of those who attended, enriching
their lives as new creatures in
Christ Jesus, and producing the
"peaceable fruits of righteousness . "
It was a joy just to see the breth-
ren arrive. They came from all
parts of the country—east, west ,
north, and south, and from Canada
and England. Large delegations
came from the Northwest, and from
Southern California . All the East-
ern States were well represented .

The weather on the opening day
was extremely warm, but the
brethren were comfortable in the
spacious, air-conditioned audito-
rium provided by the Indiana State
University. Brother Walter Bli-
charz, of Detroit, Michigan, served
as chairman on the first day, and
in keeping with the theme text of
the day, the "windows of heaven"
were truly opened, and the breth-
ren were filled with the life-giving
waters of truth.

Brother Roy Poland, of Indiana-
polis, Indiana, gave a short address
of welcome in which he said that
while all the brethren present, he
was sure, appreciated the kind
hospitality of the Indiana State
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University in serving as host to
the convention, he was confident
also that all those present had their
affections set, not on the temporal
good things with which they were
so lavishly surrounded, but upon
the spiritual food and the fellow-
ship of kindred minds which they
had come to Bloomington to enjoy .

He said, "As you traveled to
Bloomington, by train, automobile ,
bus, or airplane, I am sure you ob-
served the beauty of the earth, an d
recalled that it was created by di -
vine power, and not in vain ; that
in the divine plan it is destined to
be the everlasting home of the
natural man, under conditions of
tranquillity and joy. When viewing
the marvels of creation, how ob-
vious it becomes that it is only the
fool that says in his heart, `There
is no God . '

"We rejoice in the wonderfu l
provision God has made for man ,
and are happy to know that the
times of restitution are so near, but
in our consecration to do God ' s wil l
we have given up our earthly
hopes, and now are setting our af-
fections on things above . Our hope
now is to `win Christ,' and to see
him `face to face . ' This glorious
hope is a driving force in our lives .

"Why are we at this convention ?
One reason is found in Matthew
24:28—'Wheresoever the carcass is,



there will the eagles be gathered
together.' To eagles that `carcass '
is food, and we recognize that here
at the convention there will be
spiritual food, so we have come to
join in the feasting . In keeping
with Jesus' promise to those wh o
`hunger and thirst after righteous-
ness, ' we know that here at Bloom-
ington we are to be `filled . '

"Another reason we are here is
because we `know the joyful
sound .' The psalmist wrote, `Blesse d
is the people that know the joyful
sound: they shall walk, 0 Lord ,
in the light of thy countenance . '
(Ps. 89:15) Truly we have been
blessed! Jesus said, ` No man can
come to me, except the Father
which sent me draw him . ' What
a humbling and mellowing effect
this should have upon us . It means
that our knowledge of the `joyfu l
sound ' of ` present truth ' is ours not
through any wisdom of our own ,
but by the favor of God .

"As the harvest message was
spread abroad, by God's favor w e
recognized the joyful sound and
rallied under its banner. Like dry
and parched ground, we drank i n
the many spiritual and refreshing
truths ; and 0, how they satisfied !
By accepting these truths, an d
dedicating our lives to the divin e
cause which they reveal, we ar e
walking in the light of the Lord ' s
countenance.

"The Lord ' s people ` walk ' in the
light of his countenance, and as
they `walk, ' or make progress in
the narrow way, they find that in
every experience of life there is a
blessing. I am sure that as we left
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our homes and started toward
Bloomington our hearts `burned
within us' as we contemplated the
joys of fellowship which would be
ours as we rejoiced together with
others of like precious faith ; those
who, like ourselves, have learned
to know and to appreciate the
` joyful sound' of present truth .

"It is a joy to meet and fellow -
ship with those whom we hav e
long known and loved . It is a joy
also to become acquainted with th e
many who are here for the firs t
time. And here we are, to be to-
gether for a week. How it warms
our hearts to extend to each other
the `right hand of fellowship . '
Truly we can all say, `It is good t o
be here.'"

The First Discourse
The opening discourse of the

convention was given by Brothe r
Ernest Wylam, who used as his text
the Weymouth translation of Philip-
pians 3 :10, which reads, "I long to
know Christ, and the power which
is in his resurrection, and to share
in his sufferings. " To "know"
Christ, Brother Wylam said, means
more than to be assured that he
lived. Many of the early disciples
were acquainted with Jesus as a
man, but this did not necessarily
mean that they "knew" him within
the meaning of Paul's desire.
Theirs, as a matter of fact, was a
knowledge of Christ's "after th e
flesh," and Paul wrote that "hence-
forth know we him [so] no more . "
—II Cor. 5 :1 6

We "know" Christ as Paul wanted
to know him, through his teachings
and conduct, and this by prayerful
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study and experience. Study leads
to an abstract knowledge, a head
knowledge, and experience adde d
to the abstract leads to a heart
knowledge . This is the important
knowledge .

We can attain this heart knowl-
edge, not only through study of th e
Word, but also through contact and
fellowship with the Lord 's people ,
our brethren. Jesus said, "He that
receiveth whomsoever I send re-
ceiveth me. " (John 13:20) When
Saul of Tarsus was persecuting the
brethren, the resurrected and glo-
rified Jesus said, "Saul, Saul, why
persecuteth thou me? "—Acts 9 : 4

Yes, we see Jesus in our breth-
ren. They see him in us . I John
2:5 reads, "Whoso keepeth hi s
Word, in him verily is the love of
God perfected: hereby know w e
that we are in him . " Obedience i s
essential. We must "keep" hi s
Word, not for a day, but continu-
ally. We must "abide" in him, and
to "abide" in him, we must "walk ,
even as he walked . "—I John 2 : 6

We "walk as he walked" by
humbling ourselves . We note, for
example, his humility in washin g
his disciples' feet . Are we willin g
and glad to render such humble
service to the brethren, the little
menial services which, as a rule ,
go unnoticed by others, and often
are unappreciated by those t o
whom they are rendered ?

We learn to know Christ throug h
suffering wrong, as he suffere d
wrong. Peter wrote, "If, when ye
do well, and suffer for it, ye tak e
it patiently, this is acceptable with
God. For even hereunto were ye
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called: because Christ also suffere d
for us, leaving us an example, tha t
ye should follow his steps . "—I Pet .
2 :20, 2 1

We learn to know Christ through
cross-bearing . Paul wrote, "I am
crucified with Christ : nevertheless
I live; yet not I, but Christ liveth
in me. " "But God forgive that I
should glory, save in the cross o f
our Lord Jesus Christ, by who m
the world is crucified unto me, and
I unto the world ."—Gal . 2 :20 ; 6 :14

We become acquainted wit h
Christ through self-denial . "If any
man will come after me, let him
deny himself," said Jesus, and tak e
up his cross and follow me. (Matt.
16 :24) This means a daily denial
of self-will, a mortifying of th e
flesh and its deeds, its desires, its
preferences . As . we progress in
this, Christ becomes more dear to
us, and daily nearer.

Jesus came down from heaven ,
not to do his own will, but the will
of his Heavenly Father . At the
beginning of his ministry, he said ,
"I come to do thy will, 0 God, " and
at the end he said, "Not my will
but thine be done . " So as we pu t
down our own will, and replace i t
with the will of God, we are learn-
ing to know Christ and to have an
appreciation of the position he oc-
cupied before his Heavenly Father .

Jesus was a man of prayer, en-
joying daily communion with his
Father. We have the opportunit y
of sharing this aspect of his life
of devotion, so through prayer we
acquire an ever deepening hear t
knowledge of him. Jesus began his
ministry with prayer, and closed



it with the words, "Into thy hands
I commend my spirit . "—Luke 23 :4 6

Jesus was loyal to the Word o f
God. Familiar expressions used b y
him are : "Is it not writen? " "What
saith the Scriptures? " "Have ye
not read?" and "It is written. "
God 's Word must likewise be
planted in our hearts . As we study
to show ourselves approved unto
God, "rightly the Word of truth,"
we will be getting better and bet-
ter acquainted with Christ .

It is our privilege to fill up that
which is behind of the suffering s
of Christ, and in doing this we will
be learning to "kno' him. Can
we, as did Jesus, endure being for-
saken, reviled, persecuted, de-
spised, wounded, oppressed, falsely
accused, scorned, rejected, an d
cast out? And all of these withou t
cause? This is the fellowship o f
his suffering .

If we have this fellowship in
Christ's suffering, we will, as Paul
indicates, know the power of his
resurrection. The power of God
which raised Jesus from the dead
will stand by now to assist us in
our every time of need, and if we
are faithful unto death, will raise
us up to the divine nature, to glory ,
honor, and immortality, ever to b e
with our Lord Jesus, and with ou r
Heavenly Father, where we wil l
"know" them both perfectly and
fully, and where, therefore, there
will be joy forevermore.

Brother Hollister's Tal k
Brother Hollister gave the next

discourse, which was, in reality, a
continuation of the theme upo n
which Brother Wylam had spoken .
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Brother Hollister also presente d
Jesus to the convention, calling
attention to the many aspects o f
his life. He emphasized the fac t
that if we are to know Jesus we
must look at all sides of his spirit -
led life .

Jesus possessed implicit faith in
his Father. When on the stormy
sea of Galilee he was aroused from
sleep by his frightened disciples,
he said to them, "0 thou of littl e
faith, wherefore didst thou doubt ?"
(Matt. 14:31) If we have a strong
faith such as Jesus exercised, we
too can be calm amidst the storms
of life, for we will know that Go d
will temper the winds to our needs .

Jesus had a forgiving heart . He
was not looking for excuses to con-
demn those with whom he came in
contact . Jesus was not exclusive
in his benefactions. He accepted
the limitations of the divine plan
to confine his ministry to "the lost
sheep of the house of Israel," but
was glad to give "crumbs " of favor
to Gentiles who requested them in
faith .

Jesus did not seek vengeance on
those who opposed him. When hi s
disciples asked if they should cal l
down fire from heaven upon their
enemies, Jesus rebuked them for it.

Our study of Christ does not
have as its objective the acquirin g
of an intellectual understanding of
him, but a heart knowledge. This
heart knowledge will lead to our
being conformed to his image, and
this should be the motive of our
study .

Brother Hollister used the illus-
tration of a group of artists looking
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at a picture with the view of copy-
ing it . Each seeks his own best
vantage point. So with the Lord's
people. Each, with his own experi-
ences, possesses just that vantage
point which will enable him best to
view Christ, and to copy him. As
we thus view Christ, may we al l
become conformed more and more
to his image.

The Saturday Evening Session
On Saturday evening there wer e

two discourses. Brother George
Jeuck, of Orlando, Florida, gav e
the first one, his topic being "Our
Covenant with God." Covenants
made between men are supposed
to be binding, and how much mor e
so is our covenant with God. It is
indeed a binding instrument .

Our covenant with God, in brief ,
is an agreement to do his will, an d
to be loyal to every precept of his
Word. Since the atoning work
of the ransom is the very center of
the divine plan, our sponsoring of
anything—teachings, activities ,
etc .—which in any way might tend
to take away from the ransom,
would be disloyalty to our cove-
nant.

Our covenant with God is a cove-
nant by sacrifice. (Ps. 50:5) Taking
our sacrifice off the altar woul d
therefore be disloyalty to our cove-
nant. This might, if continued ,
ultimately lead to the second death,
as indicated in Hebrews 6:4-8 and
10:38, 39 . The issue before us in
keeping covenant with God is, in
reality, one of life and death . This
issue will be decided upon the
basis of our loyalty to the Word o f
God.
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We are to guard our thinking ,
for "as a man thinketh in his heart,
so is he." "Keep thy heart with all
diligence ; for out of it are the is -
sues of life ."—Prov. 4:23

It is a wonderful honor to be in
covenant relationship with God.
No wonder Paul wrote, "This one
thing I do ." (Phil. 3:13) We can-
not afford to give consideration t o
anything else, for the glorious priz e
at the end of the way is worth
more than all it will cost . And let
us realize that it will cost us all
that we have, that we must be
faithful even unto death .

Brother Stamulas
Brother Michael Stamulas gav e

the closing talk on the first day of
the convention. His topic was
"God's Chosen People." He used
as his text Psalm 65 :4, which reads :
"Blessed is the man whom thou
choosest, and causest to approach
unto thee, that he may dwell in thy
courts: we shall be satisfied with
the goodness of thy thouse, even
of thy holy temple. "

The reference in this text ,
Brother Stamulas explained, is t o
those whom the Lord calls durin g
the present age, and it is a great
honor to be one of this class . God
showers his mercy and love upo n
his chosen, and cares for them in
their every time of need .

There are certain steps taken by
those chosen by God . First, throug h
the truth, they are drawn to Jesus
by the Heavenly Father . Jesus
explained that no one could come
to him except when drawn by the
Father . When drawn to Jesus by
the Father, our part is to accept .



When we accept by making a full
consecration to do God's will we
are begotten by God and become
his sons, his children.

Just to believe, in the sense of
acknowledging that Jesus is our
Savior, is not enough. Jesus in-
vited us to deny self, and to take
up our cross and follow him. Paul
explains that it is given unto us,
not only to believe on him, but t o
suffer for his sake.—Phil. 1 :29

If we accept the conditions of the
call, and prove faithful even unt o
death, we will eventually be with
Jesus. If we fail to accept, our loss
will be great. The conditions of
the call lead to death ; so, if faith-
ful, we will die fulfilling those
conditions. But thus it is that we
die with Christ, that we might live
with him, suffering with him, that
we might reign with him.

And now is the time to make our
calling and our election, our choos-
ing, sure . It is blessed to be called
and chosen, but this is in vain, un-
less through diligence we prov e
faithful, thus making our calling
and our election sure.

SUNDAY, JULY 31
Chairman :

Brother Adolph Obenland
ENTERING the convention audi-

torium on Sunday, the second day
of spiritual feasting at Blooming-
ton, the brethren saw a banne r
above the platform bearing the
words of the psalmist, "A day in
thy courts is better than a thou -
sand." (Ps. 84:10) The blessings
of the first day had already prove d
these words to be true, and now
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the anticipation of the friends was
high as the fellowship and mes-
sages of the second day began.
Brother Irving C . Foss, of Los
Angeles, California, gave the open-
ing discourse, using Leviticus 23 :
15-22 as a basis for his lesson .

This passage of Scripture out -
lines God's typical arrangement s
of the "wave offering" and other
sacrifices leading up to what i s
described as "an holy convocation, "
or, shall we say, typically, a con-
vention. Brother Foss reminded
us that the typical "wave offering "
represented our continuous sacri-
fice . The one making the wave
offering did not lay it down, but
continued waving it before the
Lord until it was removed from
his hand by the priest, who repre-
sented the Lord. So with us . At
consecration we present our bodies
a "living sacrifice," and we are to
continue presenting ourselves to
the Lord until the Lord says, "I t
is enough." This we know will be
only when we have been faithful
unto death.

Our sacrifices are associated with
the divine arrangements for eradi-
cating sin from the earth, therefore
they are described by the Apostle
Paul in Romans 6 :10, 11, as bein g
"unto" or for sin, even as Jesus
died unto, or for sin . Jesus was
not himself a sinner, so he did not
die unto sin in the sense that it
died in him, but he died as a sin -
off ering . And Paul authorizes us to
reckon our own sacrifice to be "un-
to" or for sin in the same way as
Jesus ' sacrifice . "Likewise " is the
word used in the King James Ver-
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sion to describe God's viewpoint of
our "wave offering" before him .

Our sacrifice is acceptable to God
only through Christ, for we have
nothing of our own worthy to offer .
But when the Apostle Paul au-
thorizes us to reckon our sacrifice
as a part of the sin-offering, ou r
faith should lay hold upon this
marvelous arrangement God ha s
made, and believe that the meri t
of Christ is efficacious to make our
"bodies" "holy and acceptable to
God ."—Rom. 12 : 1

When all the "better sacrifices"
of the Gospel age have been of-
fered and the wave offering of the
last member of the body of Christ
has been consummated in death ,
then God 's promised blessings will
flow out to "all the families of the
earth. " But even now, Brothe r
Foss pointed out, those who come
in contact with the Lord's con-
secrated people often receive a
measure of blessing, as illustrated
by Aaron 's act of lifting up hi s
hand in blessing during the typica l
sacrifices at the installation of th e
priesthood similar to the atonement
day sacrifices and while he still
wore his sacrificial robes . Surely
the truth message of comfort and
cheer, emanating from the conse-
crated lives of God's people should
and does bring a measure of bless-
ing to many who do not themselves
join in the work of sacrifice .

Our appreciation of the truth ,
and of the precious relationship w e
enjoy with the Lord, should con-
tinue and increase, Brother Foss
told us, if we are to make ou r
"calling and election sure." It was
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our enthusiasm for the truth and
of the great God of love which th e
truth revealed to us that led t o
consecration . Only a continued
appreciation of our "first love" will
assure victory in completing our
sacrifices faithfully in death.

Brother Wilson's Lecture
The second discourse on Sunday

morning was given by Brother
George Wilson, of St. Petersburg,
Florida, formerly of Pittsburgh,
Pennsylvania. Brother Wilson's
topic was "Our Greatest Heritage . "
He used Proverbs 23 :23 as his text,
which reads, "Buy the truth, and
sell it not ." Moffat's translation
reads, "Buy the truth, and never
part with it . "

Brother Wilson said that th e
truth, the harvest message of pres-
ent truth, is our greatest heritage .
The truth reveals to us our way of
life . Even our manner of speech i s
governed to a large extent by th e
truth, so much so that it has bee n
said that the brethren have a lan-
guage all their own. It is the truth
that holds us together.

The truth, in all its phases, lik e
love, cannot be fully defined, al -
though we do have a measurabl e
understanding of the truth, an d
how we rejoice in our knowledg e
of the divine plan. We should
have the truth in our hearts, and
realize that its various doctrines
are not mere theories, or specula-
tions, but facts—facts substantiate d
by the Word of God .

The truth is our protection as
new creatures in Christ Jesus .
"His truth shall be thy shield and
buckler," said the psalmist. (Ps.



91 :4) In the New Testament the
truth is likened to a soldier's armor ,
and we are admonished to put on
the "whole armor of God."—Eph .
6 :11

Some of the details of the divin e
plan revealed to us through th e
truth are: the long night of sin an d
death is soon to terminate in a
morning of joy ; chronology an d
time prophecies ; the great "mys-
tery" hidden during previous ages
and dispensations ; the divine per -
mission of evil ; the object, manner ,
and time of our Lord's second ad-
vent; the call, development and
glorification of the church ; the
hope of restitution for the world ;
the day of judgment; the day of
vengeance of God represented in
the destruction of the kingdoms of
this world ; the two salvations ; the
"three ways"—"broad way, " "nar-
row way, " and "highway" ; and the
great "harvest " truths pertainin g
to this end of the age . Basic to
every part of the divine plan is, of
course, the ransom, and our un-
derstanding of the ransom has be -
come wonderfully clear .

Brother Wilson likened the truth
to the combination lock on a safe.
If one knows the combination h e
can open the safe, otherwise th e
safe remains closed. So a knowl-
edge of the truth opens up to us
the whole Word of God, enabling
us to see and appreciate its mar-
velous beauty and harmony.

The truth cannot be bought wit h
money. Its price is our willingness
to devote ourselves and all that w e
have to the Lord and his service.
Regardless of how little or how

23

TALKING THINGS OVE R

much any of us may have of time ,
talent, strength, or means, we hav e
just enough to buy the truth, if
we give all, and nothing short of
our all will suffice.

And we might sell the truth b y
failing to give our all after agree-
ing to do so. There is a danger
thus not only in losing or "selling"
the truth, but in losing everything ,
even life itself. The Lord does not ,
in accepting our sacrifice, take
everything away from us, but
makes us stewards of what we have
given to him, and he expects us
to be faithful in our stewardship.

As faithful stewards we are to
continue sacrificing the flesh and
its interests. We are to be faithful
to the truth itself, ever ready t o
contend earnestly for the faith
once delivered unto the saints .
And we are to hold fast to th e
truth, giving no heed to "cunningly
devised fables " which do not sat-
isfy, and lead away from the path -
way of sacrifice which is the narro w
way. Our heritage, the truth, is
too precious to be treated lightly ,
so let us give the more earnest
heed to the things which we hav e
heard, lest, as the apostle says, we
may at any time "let them slip ."—
Heb. 2 : 1

The Testimony Meeting
The first session; on Sunday

afternoon was a testimony meeting,
led by Brother Harry Passios, of
Pittsburgh, Pennsylvania. This
was an enthusiastic meeting i n
which many expressed their great
appreciation of the truth, their lov e
for the brethren, and their joy in
the privilege of being together with
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so many of "like precious faith" fo r
a week. They expressed their de -
sire, not only to receive of the
blessings provided by the Lord, but
to be a blessing to others . In this ,
it was explained, we can all be like
God, who is continually giving ,
that others might be blessed.

One brother testified that he ha d
come into contact with the truth
less than a year ago. It was ap-
parent that his joy was great. This
brother had been a minister in one
of the denominational churches ,
but now is rejoicing in the truth .
At the convention he had his first
opportunity of fellowshiping with
the Lord ' s people .

Brother Ford's Discourse
The first discourse on Sunday

afternoon was given by Brother G .
A. Ford, of England. His topic
was "Life and Ministry of Jesu s
in the Cup ." His text was John
18 :11: "The cup which my Father
hath given me, shall I not drin k
it?" This statement, Brother Ford
said, was made by Jesus as he was
leaving the Garden of Gethsemane,
thus indicating that his referenc e
was to an experience he was about
to encounter. The "cup," then, as
discussed by Brother Ford was a
figurative one representing the su m
total of all Jesus' experiences be -
ginning with his consecration an d
baptism at Jordan, and ending on
the cross when he said, "It is
finished."

When the two disciples asked
Jesus if they might sit, one on hi s
right hand and the other on hi s
left hand in the kingdom, he asked
them if they were able to drink of
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his "cup, " indicating that they
could be with him in his kingdom
only if they followed in his steps ,
participating in experiences of
trial and testing such as the Heav-
enly Father had designed for him .
Summing up the experiences of
Jesus which he feelingly traced
throughout his life of active devo-
tion to his God, Brother Ford said ,
into Jesus' cup had gone "every -
thing that life can possibly meet"

"Its commonplaces; its toil; its
obscurity ; its temptations; the
blind prejudices and hate for th e
Master; its bids for compromise ;
its lonely hours; its Gethsemanes ;
its hours before unjust judgment
seats; its mockeries ; its cross; its
forsakenness by the Father, and
finally, death."

Nevertheless in the "cup" was
also Jesus' complete triumph, for
his Father had designed also th e
resurrection ; therefore by divine
power he arose. All the other
experiences were relatively unim-
portant, except as through faith-
fulness in them Jesus was prepared
for and found worthy of experi-
encing, finally, resurrection an d
glorification with the Father, in
whose presence is fulness of joy ."

Brother MacAulay's Talk
The last discourse on Sunday

afternoon was given by Pilgrim
Brother J . Y. MacAulay. He used
Paul's second leter to Timothy as
a basis for his discussion. This was
Paul 's farewell message to Timo-
thy, for he reveals in it that the
time of his "departure" was " a t
hand. " It consists of timely warn-
ings and instructions not only to



Timothy, but to the entire church ,
especially to the church at this end
of the age, for it contains prophe-
cies of our times—"In the last days
perilous times shall come . "

One of the "perils" of the last
days, Brother MacAulay pointed
out, was that children would b e
disobedient to parents. In this
connection he spoke enthusiasti-
cally of the children of the breth-
ren whom he had learned to kno w
while in the homes of the friends
in many parts of the country. He
congratulated truth parents for
their faithfulness in properly train-
ing their children, and for teaching
them the ways of the Lord, an d
urged continued faithfulness along
this line.

In this epistle Paul also ad-
monishes us to show ourselves
approved unto God by "rightly di-
viding the Word of truth." (II Tim .
2:15) Faithfulness in this will
prevent us from being blown about
by every wind of doctrine, or being
led away by "fables," which are
mere "tales of human speculation . "

Paul wrote Timothy in this letter
that he was ready to be "offered" ;
that is, to have his sacrifice con-
summated in death . He said that
he had fought the "good fight," an d
had "kept the faith." The "faith"
referred to is our "most holy faith, "
which to us is the "old, old story "
of the Gospel, the divine plan . As
the years go by, this "faith," this
"old, old story," becomes more
wonderfully sweet .

Paul admonished Timothy to
faithfulness in passing the truth on
to others. Paul himself never fal-
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tered in his faithfulness to the "vi-
sion" of truth with which the Lord
had favored him, and it is our
privilege to follow him as he fol-
lowed the Lord. If we are to fin-
ish our course with joy, as Pau l
did, we, too, must continue faithfu l
to the Lord and to the truth, and
also zealously continue to proclaim
the glorious Gospel of the kingdom.

Sunday Evening Session
There were two inspiring dis-

courses on Sunday evening, th e
first was given by Brother Julius
Bednarz, of Chicago, Illinois . His
topic was "Time for Thee, Lord,
to Work," taken from Psalm 119 :
126, which reads : "It is time for
thee, Lord, to work: for they have
made void thy law. "

The word "work" in this text ,
Brother Bednarz explained, i s
translated from a Hebrew word
meaning to "work out, finish, o r
fulfil." The reference is to th e
completion of the divine plan in
the putting down of evil through
the establishment of the long-
promised kingdom .

In dealing with typical or fleshly
Israel, God permitted evil and vil e
men to go unhindered only until
his due time to interfere . For ex-
ample, with the overthrow o f
Zedekiah, the last Jewish king, th e
Prophet Ezekiel said, "And thou,
profane wicked prince of Israel,
whose day is come, when iniquity
shall have an end . " (Ezek. 21:25)
Because the Lord's due time had
come for the overthrow of th e
kingdom, God intervened. It was
his time to "work."
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The same is true both with th e
nominal, antitypical house of Is-
rael in this age and with the civil
governments of earth, the "king-
doms of this world ." We are now
living in the end of the age whe n
it is time for these to be over -
thrown, and this putting down of
evil institutions is the Lord's
"work," leading to the terminatio n
of the reign of sin and death.

In 1914 the "times of the Gen-
tiles ended," and it is since then
that so many crowns have toppled ,
and the disintegration of worldly
governments continues . The Lord' s
"work" in connection with this is
described by Isaiah, saying, "The
Lord shall go forth as a might y
man, he shall stir up jealousy like
a man of war : he shall cry, yea,
roar ; he shall prevail against hi s
enemies. I have long time holden
my peace; I have been still [it has
not been the time for me to
`work'], and refrained myself :
now will I cry like a travailin g
woman; I will destroy and devour
at once."—Isa . 42:13, 14

Isaiah also wrote particularl y
concerning nominal spiritual Israel ,
"It is the day of the Lord 's ven-
geance, and the year of recom-
penses for the

	

controversy

	

o f
Zion . " (Isa . 34 :8)

	

This "work"
of the Lord in the overthrow of
evil institutions, both civil and ec-
clesiastical, is shown to be accom-
plished by the "standing up" o f
"Michael" ; that is, Christ at his
second advent, resulting, as it does,
in a "time of trouble such as neve r
was since there was a nation."—
Dan. 12 :1
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The Lord's true people occupy a
wonderful position in this day o f
the Lord's wrath upon the govern-
ments and ecclesiastical organiza-
tions of earth. While their downfall
tends to fill the hearts of the people
with fear, we see it as an evidence
that our "deliverance" into the
kingdom draws near .

At the same time we have a great
responsibility as the Lord 's am-
bassadors . Our commission is out-
lined in Isaiah 61 :1-3. Here we
are told of our "anointing" by the
Holy Spirit to proclaim glad tidings
unto the meek, and to bind up th e
brokenhearted. But the commis-
sion also contains the expression ,
" to proclaim . . . the day of ven-
geance of our God ; to comfort al l
that mourn ." This indicates that
our message is not complete unless
there is included in it an explana-
tion of why the "present evi l
world" is being destroyed .

This does not mean that we ar e
to be vindictive in our presentation
of the truth. It is simply that w e
are to explain the meaning of what
is transpiring around us, which is
that the Lord 's time has come t o
"work," or to bring to a culmina-
tion his glorious purpose of estab-
lishing righteousness in the earth .
And this, obviously, calls for the
destruction of those institutions
which have fostered unrighteous-
ness, and by their doctrines and
practices have blasphemed God ' s
name. To explain the meaning o f
world events from this standpoint
should be of great comfort to those
whose hearts are filled with fear .



The Closing Discours e
The closing discourse on Sun-

day evening was given by Brother
Edmund Jezuit, of Chicago, Illinois .
His topic was "Spiritual Prosper-
ity. " His text was, "Let them shou t
for joy, and be glad, that favor m y
righteous cause : yea, let them say
continually, Let the Lord be mag-
nified, which hath pleasure in the
prosperity of his servant."—Ps .
35 :2 7

The prosperity of natural Israel ,
the Lord's people during the Jew-
ish age, was along earthly lines .
He promised to bless them in
"basket and in store" in proportion
to their faithfulness in keeping
covenant with him. During the
Gospel age the prosperity of the
Lord 's people is along spiritua l
lines ; and in our relationship with
the Lord obedience to our cove-
nant of sacrifice is the measure of
our spiritual prosperity .

The formula for spiritual pros-
perity, Brother Jezuit said, is : "0"
equals "P"—obedience equals pros-
perity. Our covenant with the
Lord calls for sacrifice, the sacri-
fice of all that we have and are .
Yet it is not sacrifice in itself for
which God is looking, but the
spirit of obedience represented by
the sacrifice. In those well-known
words of Samuel to King Saul w e
have the proper thought expressed :
"Behold to obey is better than sac-
rifice . "

The sacrifice which Saul pro -
posed to offer to the Lord was con-
trary to the instructions given him
by Samuel, who spoke for th e
Lord, hence represented disobedi -
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ence. Obedience to our covenant
calls for sacrifice, but even so, our
sacrificing must be done along lines
set forth in the Word of God, else
we will not enjoy spiritual pros-
perity .

God promised, as we have seen ,
to bless natural Israel in "basket
and in store." He fills our spiritual
"baskets" with the rich and
strengthening food from his great
storehouse of truth, and we can
continue to enjoy "prosperity" by
returning, whenever needed, to his
great storehouse to have our
"baskets" refilled. Let us never
suppose that we can enjoy spiritual
prosperity by filling our "baskets "
from any other source except his
great storehouse of truth, the in -
spired Word.

Through obedience, we can con-
tinue to enjoy the prosperity of
Zion while we lay down our lives
this side the veil ; and, if faithful
unto death, we will then enter into
that abounding wealth of kingdo m
joys on the other side . May this
glorious hope of joys to come
stimulate us to continued obedi-
ence now, and to the fullest possi-
ble "prosperity" in him!

MONDAY, AUGUST I
Chairman:

Brother Adam Miskawitz
THE first session of the conven-

tion on Monday was a testimony
meeting, led by Brother William
Moihoek, of Piqua, Ohio . Follow-
ing this the brethren were ad-
dressed by Pilgrim Brother C. W.
Zahnow, who spoke on the topic,
"Wells of the Water of Life."
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Brother Zahnow used John 4 :14 as
his text. It reads, "Whosoever
drinketh of the water that I shal l
give him shall never thirst ; but
the water that I shall give him
shall be in him a well of water
springing up into everlasting life . "

Water is used in the Scriptures
to symbolize various things, and i n
each instance its symbolic mean-
ing must be determined from th e
context or subject matter in whic h
it is used . In Psalm 69:1 we read,
"Save me, 0 God; for the water s
are come in unto my soul." Here
water is used to symbolize trouble,
affliction .

In Isaiah 8 :7 water is used to
symbolize a great multitude of
people. The text reads, "Now
therefore, behold, the Lord bring-
eth up upon them the waters of
the river, strong and many, even
the king of Assyria, and all his
glory: and he shall come up ove r
all his channels, and go over all his
banks." See also Revelation 17 :15 .

Water is also used to symboliz e
the cleansing power of the truth.
In Ephesians 5 :26 Paul writes re-
garding the "washing of water b y
the Word ." All the Lord's conse-
crated people can testify concern-
ing the powerfully c l e a n s i n g
influences of the truth.

The Bible brings to our attentio n
various other symbolic uses o f
water, but in our text, it refers t o
the refreshing, life-giving powers o f
the truth. None can obtain ever-
lasting life except through Christ ,
the Redeemer and appointed Life-
giver . So the truth which bring s
to us the privilege of manifesting

faith and obedience, and thus lay-
ing "hold of eternal life," is called
"the water of life ."—I Tim. 6 :12, 19

Having by faith partaken of the
water of life, Jesus said to those
who would drink of it that it would
be in them as a "well of wate r
springing up into everlasting life."
Only those who have laid hol d
"upon eternal life" by an accept-
ance of Christ and a consecration
to do God's will are able properl y
to give out the message of the
truth; only from these does the
"water" spring forth for the bless-
ing of others .

The Greek word in our tex t
translated "springing up" has the
thought of "gushing forth," or to
"leap out . " And how true this is
in our experience of presenting th e
truth to others . It gushes forth
with living energy . This is cor-
roborated in John 7:38, where we
read Jesus' words, "He that be-
lieveth on me, as the scripture
hath said, out of his belly shall flow
rivers of living water. "

Thus the Bible shows that all
the members of Christ's body will
be fountains of living waters ; that
is, the spreading forth of the truth
will be the uppermost thought in
their hearts, and their lives will b e
devoted to this cause. These, in
turn, will be richly blessed in thei r
privilege and opportunity of co -
operating with our Lord in giving
out the waters of life to others. If
we are following in the footsteps o f
the Master the water of life will
gush forth from our lips at al l
times.

Beginning with the apostles, and
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continuing throughout the age, all
of the Lord's true people have been
as "wells of water . " And now
particularly, at the end of the age ,
this life-giving water of truth, the
glorious Gospel of the kingdom, i s
being spread throughout all the
earth. Soon will the end come ,
and the kingdom will be fully
established .

Then that wonderful prophecy of
Ezekiel, chapter 47, will be ful-
filled. In the vision described by
Ezekiel in this chapter the prophet
sees the water of life as a "river, "
flowing and increasing throughout
the Millennium. First it is ankle
deep, and finally there were "wa-
ters to swim in, a river that could
not be passed over ." (vs. 5) This
corresponds with the "river o f
water of life " described in Revela-
tion 22 :1, 2 .

Christ and his glorified churc h
will be the source of life for the
world of mankind during the mil-
lennial age. This means that all
the "wells of water" which "gush
forth" for the blessing of other s
during the present age will com-
bine in the kingdom to form the
mighty "river of water of life," and
all mankind will be invited to
"partake" freely of this "water of
life . "

Brother French's Discourse
Brother Frank French, of Seattle,

Washington, gave the f i r s t dis-
course on Monday a f t e r n o o n ,
speaking on the topic, Welded
Together," using as a basis for his
lesson the words of Paul as re -
corded in Colossians 2 :1-11. Verse
2 speaks of "being knit together in
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love." The Diaglott translation
gives the thought of being closely
united, or welded together .

Brother French displayed a piece
of steel pipe which had been made
from two pieces welded together,
and emphasized how strongly the
two pieces were now united . This ,
he stated, is the manner in which
the Lord's true people will be
united, this union being formed by
the "blest tie that binds our hearts
in Christian love . "

In verse 1 Paul speaks of the
great "conflict" (margin, "fear or
care") he had for those at "Lao-
dicea ." While Paul's reference is
doubtless to the church in the city
of Laodicea at that time, should we
not think of them as applying t o
us who are living in the days of
figurative Laodicea, the seventh
stage of the church, as outlined in
Revelation, chapters 2 and 3 ?

These various stages of th e
church include the nominal as well
as the true, and perhaps we ar e
inclix}ed to apply the uncompli-
mentary statements in them to the
nominal church, and only apply th e
precious promises they contain to
ourselves. But Paul indicates tha t
he had fear for those in Laodicea,
and we should be on the alert lest
we find ourselves like them, who,
while they claimed to be "rich, and
increased with goods" and had nee d
of nothing, actually were "poor ,
and blind, and naked . "

We are indeed rich in the sense
that we have received the blessings
of present truth. The knowledge
of the truth has filled our hearts
with joy and inspired us to devote
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our lives to the Lord and his cause .
But, are we properly using our
blessings? Is our "first love" en-
thusiasm being maintained ?

It is our love for the Lord and
for his truth that welds us to-
gether, but that love must be main-
tained . Great heat, or fire, is use d
in the welding process, so "fiery
trials" among us should not be
permitted to disrupt our fellow -
ship. These trials should bring us
closer together as we recogniz e
our common enemy, who is Satan ,
the Devil . Proverbs 18 :24 reads ,
A man that hath friends must show
himself friendly: and there is a
friend that sticketh closer than a
brother."

The New Covenant
Brother J. H. L. Trautfelter, of

Baltimore, spoke on the topic "The
New Covenant. " After prefacing
his remarks with references to a
number of Scriptures which show
that in these "latter days" there
would come strong delusions, and
the importance of maintaining
sound doctrines in our ecclesias ,
and of contending earnestly for the
faith "once delivered unto the
saints, " Brother Trautfelter set
forth a number of logical and ir-
refutable reasons why the church
is not developed under the New
Covenant .

The original promise of the New
Covenant is recorded in Jeremiah
31:31-34 . It is a covenant which
isawith those formerly un-
der another covenant, the old Law
Covenant . We have never been
under the Law Covenant .

In making the New Covenant
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with the "house of Israel and th e
house of Judah" God's law is writ-
ten in the hearts and "inward
parts" of those with whom it is
made, indicating a return to human
perfection . The church of thi s
Gospel age does not_. .eXnerience
}his

When the New Covenant be -
comes operative no longer will i t
be necessary to "teach every man
his neighbor, . . . Know the Lord :
for they shall all know" him, "from
the least of them unto the greatest
of them." This has not been tru e
during the Gospel age .

The promise is that the New
Covenant would be made with the
the natural descendants of Abra-
ham, the Gentiles sharing in its
blessings as they come in under
its terms during the Millennium.
In Roma s chapter 1; Paul shows
when this will be; that it is after
the work of the Gospel age is com-
pleted—after the "people for his
name" have been taken out from
among the Gentiles. This is de-
scribed as "the fulness of the Gen -
tiles . "

When this Gospel-age work is
complete, then the "Deliverer "
shall come out of "Zion," the glori-
fied Christ, and "turn away un-
godliness from Jacob : for this is
my covenant unto them, when I
shall take away their sins . " (Rom.
11:26, 27) This is clearly a refer-
ence to the promise of Jeremiah
31 :31-34, and Paul unmistakably
locates its fulfilment after "the ful-
ness of the Gentiles be come in ."

God's promises of the New Cove-
nant indicate no call to sacrifice,
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theme text for the day, "Rejoicing
in hope ; patient in tribulation ;
continuing instant in prayer . "
Brother Orlando Deifer, of Allen-
town, Pennsylvania, spoke on "Re-
joicing in Hope . "

In his opening remarks Brother
Deifer explained that the hope re-
ferred to in the text was not
just any hope which a person
might entertain. He said that in
the Greek text of the New Testa-
ment the definite article "the " ap-
pears more than two thousand
times, but very seldom is this indi-
cated in our English translations.
This is true of the text under dis-
cussion . The Greek text empha-
sizes that it is " the" hope in which
we "rejoice . " "The" hope is th e
hope set forth in the divine plan ;
it is the "Gospel of Christ, " the
"faith once delivered unto the
saints . "

To have a firm hope we must b e
assured of its basis, its origin . In
Acts 24:14, 15, Paul speaks of "hope
toward God," a hope that is based
upon the promises of God. In this
case it pertains to the resurrection
of the dead, and without this hope
of a future resurrection we would
have no hope at all . Our hope,
then, is in the Lord, and in his
promises—promises upon which w e
can depend .

There are various aspects to this
hope in which we "rejoice ." In
Ephesians 1 :18 it is referred to as
the "hope of his calling . " In CoI-
ossians 1 :27 it is described as th e
"hope of glory . " In Romans 5:2 an
additional thought is added . Here
we read of the "hope of the glory

devoted to a discussion of the of God. "
3 1

whereas we are invited to ente r
into a covenant with the Lord by
sacrifice. The terms of the New
Covenant do not call for sacrifice .
To place the inauguration of the
New Covenant at Pentecost woul d
do away with God's entire plan for
the Gospel age . No place in the
plan would be found for being
"baptized" into Christ' s death, nor
for many of the privileges of the
followers of Jesus as clearly out -
lined in the New Testament .

That "Faithful and Wise Servant"
Brother Leon Norby of the New

York Ecclesia gave the closing dis-
course on Monday afternoon, using
as his topic, "That Faithful and
Wise Servant." He cited Luke 12 :
41-44 and Matthew 24:45-47 as re-
ferring to one whom the Lord
would use to dispense "meat in du e
season" in this harvest period at
the end of the age.

Brother Norby 's approach to his
topic was to show that the truths
served to the "household" through
Brother Russell are themselves th e
strongest evidence of the wonder-
ful way in which he was used b y
the Lord . Not only have we foun d
that the great fundamental truths
set forth by "that servant" are im-
possible of change without wresting
the Scriptures, but even in the
finer points of truth he surpasse d
the rest of us in stating them in
clarity. It was an encouraging
lesson, stimulating to faith in th e
Lord 's arrangements for his peo-
ple at this end of the age .

The Monday Evening Session
The Monday evening session was
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In Romans 8 :24 the "hope" re-
ferred to, the hope in which we
rejoice, is the hope of joint-heir-
ship with Jesus in his kingdom.

In II Corinthians 3 :12 the ex-
pression, "such hope" is found, and
the context reveals that the refer-
ence is to a share with Christ in
the administration of the Ne w
Covenant . In this context we are
referred to as "able ministers of
the new covenant."—vs. 6

Romans 15 :13 speaks of abound-
ing in hope . The text reads, "Now
the God of hope fill you with all
joy and peace in believing, that ye
may abound in hope, through the
power of the Holy Spirit." This
"hope" which is set before us by
the promises of God is a stayin g
influence in our lives. We have
"laid hold" upon it, says Paul, and
have found it to be "an anchor of
the soul, both sure and stedfast,
and which entereth into that within
the veil."—Heb . :186, 19

This hope in which we rejoic e
brings responsibility . The Apostl e
John emphasizes this . He wrote,
"Every man that hath this hope in
him purifieth himself, even as he
is pure ." (I John 3:3) Let us
then, beloved, increase our rejoic-
ing in the hope set before us by
zealously conforming ourselves to
the conditions attached to it .

"Patient in Tribulation"

Brother Claude R. Weida, of
Allentown, Pennsylvania, spoke o n
the subject, "Patient in Tribula-
tion." He reminded the brethren
that the fruition of the hope in
which we rejoice depends upon

our faithfulness under trial, tha t
even Jesus, the "Captain of our
salvation," before entering into hi s
glory, was tested: "For it became
him, for whom are all things, . . .
in bringing many sons unto glory ,
to make the Captain of their sal-
vation perfect through sufferings."
—Heb. 2 :10

Brother Weida explained that
the word "tribulation" is derived
from a Latin word meaning roller ,
or threshing machine . So it is that
our "tribulations," our trials, are
necessary in order that the "wheat "
of our characters might be sepa-
rated from the "chaff. "

Perhaps none of the Lord's peo-
ple have endured more or greate r
trials than the Apostle Paul, ye t
in II Corinthians 4 :17 he refers to
them as "light afflictions" no t
worthy to be compared with the
"eternal weight of glory" which is
the "hope" of all the true followers
of the Master. But patience is re-
quired if we are to look upon ou r
trials as "light afflictions ." Paul
wrote, "Ye have need of patience ,
that, after ye have done the will o f
God, ye may receive [fulfilmen t
of] the promise ."—Heb . 10:36

Patience—that is, cheerful en-
durance—is necessary all along th e
way. A few short experiences of
trial, of tribulation, are not enough.
We must be faithful unto death.
Jesus speaks of this as enduring
"unto the end." So, brethren, le t
us continue to "run with patience "
the race that is set before us, look-
ing unto Jesus, who is the Author
and the Finisher of our faith .
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"Continuing Instant in Prayer"
The subject suggested by the last

part of Romans 12 :12—"Continu-
ing Instant in Prayer"—was dis-
cussed by Pilgrim Brother G . P.
Ostrander. He referred to th e
Weymouth translation of the text,
which states that we should b e
"earnest and persistent in prayer . "

The Bible calls attention to many
circumstances in which prayer is
appropriate . In fact, every ex-
perience of life affords an oppor-
tunity for prayer . Our "Vow Unto
the Lord" states "Daily will I re-
member at the throne of heavenly
grace the general interests of the
harvest work . "

Jesus instructed his disciples to
pray that the Lord would send
more reapers into the harvest . This
also affords us an opportunity for
prayer, for it is surely true today
that the work is great but the la -
borers few .

Paul asked the Colossian breth-
ren to pray that a "door of utter-
ance to speak the mystery of
Christ" might be given unto him.
(Col . 4:3) Sometimes we may fee l
that we lack opportunity to wit-
ness for the truth, or otherwise to
serve the Lord. If so, we should
make it a matter of prayer—
prayer for opportunities to serve,
and prayer for wisdom and strength
to use properly whatever oppor-
tunities the Lord may give us .

Today our prayers for the Lord' s
people and for the Lord's work
should include the radio witness ,
the activities of the ecclesias, fo r
those who distribute literature, in
fact, for the Lord's work as a
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whole . Being united in prayer will
help to keep us united in the
service to the glory of God .

Writing to the Colossian brethre n
Paul said, I "do not cease to pray
for you, and to desire that ye might
be filled with the knowledge o f
His will in all wisdom and spirit-
ual understanding . " (Col. 1:9)
This is another example of how we
may pray for our brethren and for
ourselves .

We are to pray for those who err .
The Apostle John mentions this,
saying, "If any man see his brother
sin a sin which is not unto death,
he shall ask, and he shall give hi m
life for them that sin not unto
death ." (I John 5:16) John ex-
plains that "there is a sin unto
death ." For such wilful sins we
are not to pray, but great assist-
ance can be rendered to those
whose sins of weakness have
brought discouragement .

We should pray for our enemies ,
those who despitefully use us . We
are to pray for our own forgive-
ness, realizing, however, that the
Lord will not forgive us our tres-
passes against him unless we for-
give those who trespass against us .
This reveals the great importance
of being in the proper attitude o f
heart when we approach the throne
of heavenly grace in prayer.

When Peter was in prison, praye r
was offered for him, and in answer
to those prayers he was released ,
the door of the prison being opened
by "the angel of the Lord." (Acts
12:5-10) The Lord's people are no t
always delivered from physical
hardship through prayer, but only
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when it is the Lord's will . All our
requests, therefore, of whateve r
nature, should be modified with
our expression of desire that the
Lord's will be done .

In John 15:16 we are instructe d
that our prayers must be in the
name of Jesus. We might have a
very dear friend who had consid-
erable money in the bank, but we
could not go to the bank with th e
explanation that we knew this
person and ask for some of his
money. But if the friend signed a
check which we could present, an d
indicated on the check how much
he wanted us to have, the ban k
would honor the check and w e
would receive the money . So our
prayers to God, when "signed" by
Jesus, are honored .

The most comprehensive of al l
our prayers is the request given u s
by Jesus: "Thy kingdom come.
Thy will be done in earth, as it is in
heaven . " (Matt . 6:10) This is a
prayer for the prosperity of the di -
vine plan for the blessing of all the
families of the earth, and we know
that in due time it will be answered .

Our text says that we should be
" instant in prayer, " or "earnest an d
persistent . " In I Thessalonians
5 :17 Paul gives us a similar
thought, admonishing us to "pray
without ceasing ." In other words ,
we are not to give up the habit o f
prayer, but to seek the Lord's
blessing in all that we say and do .
And besides all this, we are i n
everything to give thanks .—I Thess.
5 :18

TUESDAY, AUGUST 2
Chairman : Brother Everett Murray

THE opening session of the con-
vention on Tuesday was addressed
by Brother Jens Copeland, of
Chicago, Illinois . Brother Cope-
land spoke on the theme text fo r
the day, "Ye are the light of the
world. " (Matt. 5 :14) This text, he
explained, is a part of Jesus' "Ser-
mon on the Mount, " which was ad-
dressed, not to the multitude, but
to his own disciples . See verse 2 .

To make this applicable to our -
selves all we need to do is to
change the "ye" to "we," and read
it, "We are the light of the world . "
We could make it even more per-
sonal and read it, "I am the ligh t
of the world . " In this way it ap-
plies to each one of us personally .
This application makes each one
of us personally responsible for
being a channel through which the
light of the Gospel may shine ou t
to those whom we are surrounded.

While Jesus was in the world as
a man he was the light of the
world, the only channel of divine
truth; but now we, as his am-
bassadors, have been given that
responsibility, the responsibility to.
let our light shine . Jesus indicate s
that .we should "let" our light
shine, as though the only reason it
would not shine would be our hid-
ing it under one or anothe r
"bushel." The light of the Gospel
will shine out through us unles s
we put hindrances in its way .

There are "lights" of various
sorts in the world, but the "light"
in which we are interested, the
light which we are to let "shine,"
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is the Gospel, God 's great plan o f
the ages. We have no light of ou r
own. It is only necessary, as il-
lustrated by Gideon 's army, that
we break our "earthen vessels, "
that the light which our Captai n
has given may be seen, may shine
out for the blessing of others .

The question naturally arises,
"How can I let my light shine ;
what is the best method? " Col-
lectively, as a group of the Lord's
people, we can send out the knowl-
edge of the divine plan by sup-
porting the printing of literature ;
by supporting the radio witness,
the pilgrim service, the recorde d
lecture service, and also the foreig n
work. Any or all of these we ca n
support collectively by our prayers,
and otherwise as we have oppor-
tunity .

Individually, we can advertis e
the radio programs ; distribut e
tracts; mail letters to the bereaved ;
call on those who have heard th e
truth over the radio and have sent
for literature . In the case of thes e
we can, where there is opportunity ,
arrange to have personal studie s
with the interested, helping them
to understand the fundamentals o f
the truth, that, when they attend
our regular meetings, they will re-
ceive a greater blessing .

In a more personal sense, we can
witness to our neighbors, the gro-
cery man, the baker, the candle -
stick maker ; to our friends in the
office, the shop . There is also the
opportunity of leaving kingdo m
cards here and there as we go fro m
place to place throughout the day .
We can also go from door to door
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with tracts, and, if we have oppor-
tunity, also with books and book -
lets. All of these are ways an d
means by which we can let our
light shine.

And let us watch our conduct ,
for this too is important in ou r
witness work. Weymouth 's trans-
lation of I Peter 2 :12 reads, "Live
honorable lives among the Gen -
tiles, in order that, although the y
now speak against you as evildoers ,
they may yet witness your goo d
conduct and may glorify God on
the day of reward and retribution."
If we teach the truth, and that peo-
ple should live according to the
Bible, and we do not so conduct
ourselves, our preaching will be i n
vain .

Brother Baker's Lecture
The second discourse on Tuesda y

morning was also on the topic the
light of the world, based upon the
theme text for the day—Matthew
5 :14. It was given by Pilgrim
Brother Samuel A. Baker. Brother
Baker said that all texts of Scrip-
ture are like the brush strokes of
an artist . One stroke alone does
not make a picture. The picture
is the result of many strokes of the
brush. So the Bible, as a picture ,
must be considered in its entiret y
if we are to see it as a beautiful
and harmonious picture .

Our text, "Ye are the light of the
world," is like one brush stroke o f
the artist. It is not the whole pic-
ture . Speaking to his disciples on
another occasion, Jesus said, "Ye
are my friends, if ye do whatsoeve r
I command you." (John 15 :14 )
This, again, enlarges the picture
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somewhat, but still it is not the
whole picture .

Another of Jesus' command-
ments is found in Matthew 28 :19 .
Speaking to his disciples after his
resurrection, he said, "Go ye and
teach all nations." Now a small
part of the picture begins to tak e
on meaning . From these three texts
we begin to see something . We
begin to see that we can be th e
"light of the world" if we obey his
commandment to preach the Gos-
pel in the world .

Jesus said to his disciples, "As
long as I am in the world, I am th e
light of the world." (John 9 :5 )
This implies that when Jesus would
go away someone else would be th e
light of the world, and the texts,
the "brush strokes," already ex-
amined, indicate that this role was
to be filled by Jesus' disciples .

Jesus' disciples, although for the
most part ignorant and unlearned
men, quickly partook of his spirit,
and he taught them concerning his
kingdom. Later, after his resur-
rection, and the Holy Spirit had
been poured out upon the waitin g
church, the people perceiving th e
boldness of the disciples and the
similarity of their message to that
which Jesus had proclaimed, took
note that they had been with Jesus,
and had learned of him. Jesus in-
tended that they should carry on
the work which he had started, and
in the divine providence they were
properly prepared for it .

The "brush strokes" of the artist
now reveal clearly that all the tru e
followers of Jesus are his ambassa-
dors, commissioned to reveal to the
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world the light which has shined
into their hearts. What a solemn
thought! What a responsibility !

We know that Jesus expected hi s
disciples to consider this commis-
sion carefully, and to be guided by
it . He said, "Neither do men light
a candle, and put it under a bushel ,
but on a candlestick; and it giveth
light unto all that are in the house ."
(Matt. 5:15) This was, and is, a
warning that the light which i s
given to us should shine out fro m
us that others may be enlightened
and blessed .

So it is that when Jesus, "the
light of the world," died on the
cross, he did not leave the worl d
without light . His disciples ha d
been with him, and had learned o f
him. He could entrust them with
the kingdom message . They had
some experience in light-bearing
while Jesus was still with them,
but now they were to be enlight-
ened further by the Holy Spirit ,
and were to preach the Gospel
world-wide, beginning at Jerusa-
lem.

The great biblical picture, painte d
as it is by so many artists under
the direction of the Lord, the Mas-
ter Artist, is prophetically pro-
jected into our day, revealing that.
now, even as in the past, we are to
be the "light of the world." Are
we in the picture? Are we ful-
filling our commission? Are we
letting our light shine ?

Brother Poe' s Discours e
The afternoon session opene d

with a praise and testimony meet-
ing led by Brother Arthur Krum-
polt, of the New York Ecciesia .



Then followed a discourse b y
Brother Wilbur N . Poe, of Cincin-
nati . Brother D. J. Morehouse.

,of Chicago, was scheduled to speak
.at this time, but was unable to b e
present . Brother Poe 's topic was
"Do Business Till I Come," taken
from The Parable of the Pounds
(Luke 19:13), which, he explained ,
is the thought in the King James
translation which reads, "Occupy
till I come . "

It is obvious that the "working
capital, " the "pounds" of the para-
ble, with which the church was to
do business, was revealed trut h
and such helps as the Father woul d
provide. Jesus frequently quoted
the ancient prophecies which h e
had come to fulfil, indicating that
the interests for which his disciples
were soon to be responsible con-
sisted of both the Old and New
Testament Scriptures.

Jesus explained that the way to
the kingdom of which he had
spoken was narrow and rugged ,
encompassed with deceivers and
opposers, among whom the tru e
church would be like a lamp in a
dark place—a candle on a hill . The
light of truth for which they were
responsible, he said, must be pro -
claimed in all the world .

No small part of Jesus' work wa s
public teaching, and this resulted
in his being persecuted . He was
not persecuted because he pos-
sessed the fruits of the Spirit in
perfection, but because he publicly
rejected the false theories of hi s
time, and preached truths which
were unpopular, including the fact
that ultimately a new kingdom, or
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government, was to be established .
The disciples were persecuted be-
cause they were faithful to the
same truths, and proclaimed the m
in the same manner .

Paul was persecuted because he
preached Jesus and the resurrec-
tion of the dead . He foretold tha t
"perilous times " would come in the
"last days," when men would be
"lovers of pleasures more than
lcvers of God . " He explained tha t
all who would live godly in Chris t
Jesus, following the same cours e
in life as the Master, would suffe r
persecution .—II Tim. 3:1-5

One of the strong delusions of
the age is that being a Christian
is little more than having a swee t
and upright character . This is par t
of what it means to be a Christian ,
but the Scriptures show that being
a Christian involves much more.
Such a life would not have brough t
crucifixion to Jesus, nor stripes
and imprisonments to Paul ; nei-
ther would it today separate
"wheat" from "tares ."

Faith cannot properly be sepa-
rated from teachings, becaus e
sound doctrine is the substance ,
the basis, upon which faith is built.
Jesus ' advice to the young rich
man who was seeking eternal lif e
is still sound . He said to him, "Go
sell that thou hast, . . . and come
and follow me." (Matt. 19:21) Do
as I am doing, in other words .
What was Jesus doing? He was
publicly proclaiming unpopular
doctrine, and comforting the
mourners .

When seeking patterns for th e
Christian life, we should not g o
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to the Middle Ages, but to the
Early Church. For example, in th e
2nd chapter of Acts, verses 41 an d
42, we read, "they that gladly re-
ceived" Peter's words "were bap-
tized : . . . and they continue d
stedfastly in the apostles ' doctrin e
and fellowship, and in breaking of
bread, and in prayers ."

Continued faithfulness to th e
truth and a zealous, daily effort to
make it known to others is the way
in which we can "do business till
he come, " and until he receives us
unto himself . When the reckoning
with his servants by the returne d
Lord has finally been completed,
only such as are faithful in the us e
of his "goods" may expect to hear
the "well done."

Brother Penrose Speak s
The last discourse on Tuesday

afternoon was given by Brother
E. K. Penrose of Columbus, Ohio .
His topic was "The Importance of
Working Out Our Own Salvation, "
taken from Philippians 2 :12, 13 :
"Wherefore, my beloved, as ye hav e
always obeyed, not as in my pres-
ence only, but now much more in
my absence, work out your own
salvation with fear and trembling ;
for it is God which worketh in you
both to will and to do of his good
pleasure . "

This exhortation by the Apostle
Paul was not only designed to
benefit the Early Church, but the
entire church down through the
age, even to this end . It is just as
important for us to work out ou r
own salvation as it was for the
Philippian church . But why does
Paul urge us to do something
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which has already been done fo r
us? Has not salvation been pro-
vided for us through Christ as a
free gift ?

It is through our Lord Jesus
Christ that our salvation has bee n
made possible. We cannot work
out our justification, for we ar e
justified by faith, "through our
Lord Jesus Christ . " (Rom. 5 :1 )
It is to those who have reached
this position through a faith dem-
onstrated by a full consecration to
whom Paul is writing . While we
cannot earn, or "work out" our
salvation from death, there is a
"salvation " which we can "work
out, " not by ourselves, but becaus e
the Lord is working in us "to wil l
and to do of his good pleasure ."

What is this salvation that we
are now to "work out" with "fear
and trembling" ? Paul describes it
as "so great salvation ; which at th e
first began to be spoken by our
Lord, and was confirmed unto u s
by them that heard him." (Heb .
2:3) It is not just a salvation from
sin and death back to human per-
fection. It is much more than that .
Peter describes it as "an inherit-
ance incorruptible, and undefiled ,
and that fadeth not away, reserved
in heaven for you, who are kept by
the power of God through faith
unto salvation ready to be revealed
in the last time. "—I Pet . 1 :4, 5

It is this that we are to "work
out with "fear and trembling, "
this "so great " salvation. What a
blessed opportunity the Heavenly
Father has extended to us! But
Paul does not mean, of course, that
we should literally tremble with



fear before the Lord . How could
we be afraid of God, who has bee n
so kind and merciful to us? Paul
uses this language to impress upon
us the great responsibility which
is now ours. This covenant with
the Lord into which we have en-
tered is not a light thing . Our
eternal interests are involved in it .

What will be the result of ou r
"work" in this great project? If
faithful it will be "glory and honor
and immortality." (Rom. 2 :7) We
would have need literally to "trem-
ble" were it not for the assuranc e
that God is working in, or with u s
in the undertaking. In this con-
nection Paul assures us that "he
which hath begun a good work i n
us will finish (margin) it, until the
day of Jesus Christ . " (Phil . 1 :6 )
This, of course, is predicated on th e
assumption that we will allow Go d
to continue working in us, and tha t
we will zealously and faithfully
work together with him.

What a glorious prospect is ours !
What a wonderful salvation! It is
to be a part of the "bride" of Christ ,
to share with our Heavenly Bride -
groom in his glory and immortality
and kingdom. That, friends, will
be the result of our faithful efforts
to work out our own salvation .
May this joy that is set before u s
give us courage and strength t o
continue on faithfully working to-
gether with our Lord !

WEDNESDAY, AUGUST 3
Chairman: Brother Leo B . Post
THE first session of the conven-

tion on Wednesday, after the usua l
morning devotions, was a baptis-
mal service for the benefit of those
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who desired to symbolize thei r
consecration to be dead with Christ
that they might live with him, to
suffer with him that they migh t
reign with him. Brother W. N .
Woodworth gave the discourse .

It was pointed out that wate r
immersion is merely a symbol o f
the real baptism—the submerging
of one's will into the will of the
Lord, a full dedication of oneself to
do God 's will as it is expressed in
his Word, and to accept the head-
ship of Christ . As is usual these
days, a number of those who re -
quested to be immersed had first
heard the truth through the "Frank
and Ernest" broadcasts .

The right hand of fellowship wa s
given, not in the name of a de -
nomination, nor of any earthly
organization, but on behalf of the
Lord's people assembled at the
convention and everywhere, and in
the name of the Lord . Brother
Samuel Clements, of Seattle ,
Washington, was the immerser.

Brother Sundbom's Discourse
The afternoon session on Wednes-

day began with a discourse b y
Brother C. A. Sundbom, of Sagi-
naw, Michigan . Brother Sundbom ' s
topic was "Sanctified by God' s
Will," based on Hebrews 10:9, 10 .
These verses read, "Then said he ,
Lo, I come to do thy will, 0 God .
He taketh away the first, that he
may establish the second . By the
which will we are sanctified throug h
the offering of the body of Jesu s
Christ once for all. "

In what way does the true Chris-
tian differ from others? In good
works? No, because there are
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others who also do good things. In
self-denial? No, for there are
those who also practice self-denial .
Some worldly people even suffe r
for righteous causes . The only
thing which none but Christian s
do is to take God's will as thei r
own ; God's will, that is, as it i s
written in his Word.

Putting God 's will first effects a
great change in us, especially in
our minds . So great is this change
that I Corinthians 2 :16 states, "We
have the mind of Christ ." This
chapter shows what it means to
have the mind of Christ . For one
thing, we are able to know the
mysteries of God, to discern thing s
hidden from the natural man .

The new mind is spiritual be-
cause it is begotten by God's truth .
It is spiritual also because it is a
part of the "new creature" which ,
in the resurrection, will receive a
divine body. It is the same min d
which Jesus had after his baptism .

I Corinthians 2:7 explains tha t
this mind of Christ has "hidden
wisdom which God ordained be -
fore the world unto our glory . "
This wisdom is hidden because the
natural man cannot comprehend
the wisdom of God .

The mind of Christ includes the
determination to do God's will a t
any cost . In Philippians 2 :5 we
have this statement : "Let this min d
be in you which was also in Chris t
Jesus." Verses 7 and 8 explain
that this mind caused Jesus to
make himself of no reputation, an d
to become obedient unto death ,
even the death of the cross . It re-
quired a very strong determina -
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tion on the Lord's part to contro l
himself and to sacrifice his hu-
manity completely .

Behind this was a clear knowl-
edge of God's plan—what God
wanted to do, and how and why ..
A skilled workman must know what
he is doing, and why, or soon he
not only loses interest in his work ,
but also is unsuccessful in what h e
is doing. So with us, a clear
knowledge of God's plan is neces-
sary, first to inspire a strong deter-
mination to do God's will, and also
to reveal his will to us. And only
if this determination continues can
we be successful in carrying out
that will.

Before we can get a clear knowl-
edge of God's plan, we must have
a willing mind—we must be will-
ing to obey God. Jesus said that
if any man willed to do God's will,
he would know the doctrine, or
God's teachings . In this same con-
nection Jesus explained that a tru e
teacher of God's truth, or doctrine ,
will seek God's glory, not his own .
—John 7 :15-18

Doing God's will as it is written
in the Word sanctifies us, sets us
apart for God's holy service . It
also transforms us by renewin g
our minds . God's will is, in reality ,
as a new manager of our lives. It
is the mind or disposition of Christ ..
He is our Head. We are to let thi s
mind rule us until our sacrifice i s
finished .

According to Romans 6 :13 we are
to "yield our members as instru-
ments of righteousness unto God . "
Depraved tendencies must be put
to death. Good tendencies must



be put to work doing God's will .
Mercy, sympathy, justice, truth ,
and other good qualities, are to be
exercised as much as possible .

We could not do God's will ac-
ceptably apart from the merit of
the ransom. On this basis, our con-
secration is acceptable, and our
conscience is clear before God. But
it is necessary to keep our con -
science clear by watching our
thoughts and words and actions ,
keeping them fully in harmony
with our vow of consecration.
Thus the will of God continues to
be done in our mortal bodies.

Brother Morehouse's Discourse
Following Brother Sundbom's

lecture there was an inspiring tes-
timony meeting led by Brother
Charles Zubowsky, of La Salle ,
Illinois. Then Brother D. J . More-
house, of Chicago, addressed the
convention. His topic was, "The

• Light of the World Is Jesus," which ,
he said, was suggested by Hymn
No. 297 in Hymns of Dawn, one
verse of which states : "Once I wa s
blind, but now I can see ; the Light
of the world is Jesus . "

This hymn is based on the story
of how Jesus healed a man who
was born blind, as recorded in
John 9 :1-7. This miracle was per-
formed on the sabbath, and Jesu s
was accused of breaking the law
by thus working on the sabbath .
These enemies said to the heale d
man, "Give God the praise: we
know that this man [Jesus] is a
sinner . " (John 9:24) In other
words, they wanted the man to be-
lieve that his eyesight had been
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restored by God apart from any
connection with Jesus .

Then the man answered,
"Whether he [Jesus] be a sinne r
or no, I know not : one thing I
know, that, whereas I was blind,
now I see." (John 9:25) We can
use this story to illustrate how onc e
we were blind to God's plan of
salvation, but since we have en-
tered the antitypical sabbath (1874 )
our eyes have been opened .

This work of opening the eyes of
those whom the Lord is calling
continues . The "four winds" of
the great "time of trouble" are be-
ing held back until all "the serv-
ants of God are sealed in their
foreheads."—Rev. 7 :2, 3

How glad we are that the Lord
has opened the eyes of our under -
standing to "see" the glories of his
plan . How glad we are to see the
two salvations, that the world i s
not now to be converted, that thi s
feature of the divine plan is re-
served for the Millennium .

Another thing we now
which is of particular concern to
the Lord 's people in this end of the
age is the fact of Christ's invisible
presence. How clear are the
prophecies which show that th e
"watchers" would discern his pres-
ence, while to the world his com-
ing would be as a "thief in the
night . " We see him by means of
the signs which betoken his pres-
ence .

Jesus said, "Then shall appear
the sign of the Son of Man in
heaven: and then shall all the
tribes of the earth mourn, and they
shall see the Son of Man coming
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in the clouds of heaven with powe r
and great glory." (Matt. 24:30 )
This indicates that as the great
"time of trouble" increases in se-
verity, eventually "they," the
world, will begin to recognize th e
significance of events. This fore-
told mourning of the "tribes of
earth" has already begun, and i s
represented in the "distress of na-
tions with perplexity" foretold by
Jesus .—Luke 21 :25-27

Meanwhile we rejoice, as part of
the "wise virgin" class, to "see "
that the Bridegroom has come, that
we have heard the proclamation,
"Behold the bridegroom." (Matt.
25 :6) This reveals that, with the
return of our Lord, there was to
begin a "harvest" work, and w e
rejoice to "see " that this work ha s
been going on, and we are happy
to have a part in it .

We "see" also, that since the
King has returned, the long-prom-
ised kingdom is near, that soon the
"mountain of the house of the Lord
shall be established in the top o f
the mountains, . . . and people shall
flow unto it ."—Micah 4 :1-4
Because we "see" these things, le t

us be "stedfast and unmoveable ,
always abounding in the work o f
the Lord ."—I Cor . 15:58

THURSDAY, AUGUST 4
ON THURSDAY Brother Charles

Chupa served as chairman. Im-
mediately following the morning
devotions, Brother Harry Herr-
scher, of Phoenix, Arizona ad-
dressed the convention on th e
topic, "The Seed is the Word of
God, " taken from Luke 8 :11—" Now
the parable is this : The seed is the

Word of God ." The "Word" of
God referred to in this parable,
Brother Herrscher said, include s
the entire revelation of the divine
plan as we find it in the Law and
the prophets, and in the teaching s
of Jesus and the apostles— "all
Scripture given by inspiration of
God."—II Tim. 3:16, 1 7

The Apostle Peter defined this
pure "seed," when he wrote, we
are "begotten again, not of cor-
ruptible seed, but of incorruptible ,
by the Word of God, which liveth
and abideth for ever ." (I Pet.
1 :23) In prayer to his Father on
behalf of his disciples Jesus said ,
Sanctify them through thy truth ,
thy Word is truth ."—John 17 :1 7

The Parable of the Sower shows
the various steps in the call, re-
sponse, and development of th e
church, the members of Christ's
body. It also illustrates the proper
heart attitude necessary, the proper
"soil," in which the "seed" of
truth can find lodging, germinate ,
grow to maturity, and bring forth
fruit.

As the parable indicates, some of
the "seed" scattered by the sower
"fell by the way side; and it was
trodden down, and the fowls of the
air devoured it. " (Luke 8 :5) The
"way side " hearers are those with
hard, unresponsive hearts . These
hear the Word, but do not "re-
ceive" it . Oftentimes, in fact, these
become persecutors of those who
proclaim the message.

And then, as the parable also
shows, some of the "seed" "fell
upon a rock ; and as soon as it was
sprung up, it withered away, be -
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cause it lacked moisture ." (Luke
8:6) Jesus explains that these stony
ground Christians fall away in
"time of temptation, " or testing.
(Luke 8 :13) They rejoice greatly
when they first hear the truth, ac-
knowledging that they never be-
fore heard anything that was so
satisfying ; but when they learn
that their friends, their relatives
perhaps, or their friends in th e
church, are not in harmony with
the message they "wither."

Some of the "seed" of the "sow-
er," according to the parable, falls
among "thorns . " These, Jesus ex -
plains, are those who become
choked with " the cares of this life . "
The things which they can see and
feel, the temporal good things of
life, absorb their interest. To these
the cost of discipleship is too great ,
and they do not go on to brin g
forth fruit of the "Spirit . "

"And other fell on good ground, "
Jesus said, "and sprang up, and
bare fruit an hundredfold . " (Luke
8 :8) These, Jesus explained, "are
they, which in an honest and good
heart, having heard the Word ,
keep it, and bring forth fruit with
patience. "—vs . 1 5

Fundamental to the bringing forth
of "fruit," then, is the good "seed, "
the pure Word of God, and an hon-
est, sincere heart. But beyond this ,
as Jesus explained, is the need of
patience. Paul wrote, "Ye have
need of patience, that, after ye
have done the will of God, y e
might receive the promise . " (Heb .
10 :36) The "good ground" Chris-
tians permit neither persecution
nor the cares of this world to in -

43

TALKING THINGS OVER

terfere with their growth and frui t
bearing .

Brother Samuel's Discourse
Brother Victor Samuel, of Phila-

delphia, Pennsylvania, followe d
Brother Herrscher, speaking on th e
topic, "Faith on Trial . " As his text
Brother Samuels used I Peter 1 :7 ,
which reads, "That the trial of
your faith, being much more pre-
cious than of gold that perisheth ,
though it be tried with fire, migh t
be found unto praise and honor
and glory at the appearing of Jesus
Christ . "

The two elements of faith, intel-
lectual assurance and heart reli-
ance, are necessary if we are t o
win divine approval . Both the
"head " and the "heart "—the intel-
lect and the affections—are neces-
sary to that faith without which
"it is impossible to please God . "
(Heb. 11:6) We must have both
these elements if we are to endur e
unto the end, and be found unt o
praise and honor and glory at th e
appearing of Jesus Christ .

We must have an intellectual
grasp of the fundamental principle s
of divine truth—that there is a
personal God, intelligent, that he i s
the Creator and sustainer of al l
things. We must also believe hi s
plan of redemption through hi s
only begotten and well beloved
Son, our Lord Jesus Christ . Such
is the foundation of our faith, and
we must trust our God and rely
on his promises.

The trial of our faith to which
the Lord and the apostles refer i s
therefore a trial, not only of ou r
intellectual recognition of divine
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truth, but also of our heart reliance
upon God. In both these respects
every true child of God will fin d
his faith severely tried .

If an attack is made upon the in-
tellectual foundation of our faith,
we should see to it that we have a
"thus saith the Lord" for every
item of our belief . Let the Word
of God settle every question, for i f
the foundation of our faith is no t
settled we cannot stand when the
"winds" and the "floods" of ad-
versity and temptation beat agains t
us .

The Apostle Peter tells us that a
tried, proved faith, a faith which
has stood the test of fiery ordeal ,
and has come off victorious, is very
precious in the sight of God . Every
time we pass through a conflict
and still retain, not only the truth
but also our confidence in God and
reliance upon his promises—in the
"dark" as well as in the "light"—
our faith is strengthened .

In Psalm 34:19 we read these
consoling words : "Many are the
afflictions of the righteous : but the
Lord delivereth him out of them
all . " And in Psalm 31 :24 we read ,
"Be of good courage, and he shall
strengthen your heart, all ye that
hope in the Lord. " Though tempes t
tossed and suffering, let us remem-
ber the words of the Apostle Paul ,
"The Lord is faithful, who shall
stablish you, and keep you from
evil ."—II Thess. 3 : 3

Are you then hard pressed on
every side, with temptations to
doubt that God's protection, love ,
and care are yours? Have you
grown discouraged and disheart-

ened? Do the foes seem too man y
and too strong? Do the reproaches
come with crushing weight, and d o
the clouds hang heavy over your
head? Ah, it is just here that fait h
must claim her victory . John
wrote, "For whatsoever is born o f
God overcometh the world : and
this is the victory that overcomet h
the world, even our faith. " (I John
5:4) It is faith that is now on trial.

The Last Testimony Meetin g
The last testimony meeting o f

the convention was led by Brother
William Pardue, of St. Louis, Mis-
souri . It was an enthusiastic one .
By means of tape recording Broth-
ers William Pampling, Charles
Cornell, and Joseph Murray, o f
England, testified at this meeting .
Their testimonies follow :

This is Brother Pampling o f
Romford, England. Sister Pamp-
ling joins with me in sending
Christian greetings of love, joy ,
and peace to all gathered in con-
vention, for we do thank God upon
every remembrance of you .

We continue to live in wonderful
times. When viewing world events
today we sometimes make use o f
the poet's words, and say, "We are
living, we are dwelling, in a gran d
and awful time." The vast major-
ity of people will agree that we are
living, we are dwelling, in an awful
time, but not in a grand time . They
see the awfulness of the times, but
they see little of their grandeur .
This is reserved for those who have
been called out of darkness into
light . How glad we are to be num-
bered amongst those so favored .
When viewing world event s
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through the field glasses of our
Heavenly Father's Word of truth ,
we cannot help but be thrille d
when we see prophecies being ful-
filled and the divine purpose ac-
complished . That purpose is clearly
stated in Numbers 14 :21: "But as
truly as I live, all the earth shall
be filled with the glory of Jehovah."

May this 1955 convention be to
all a time of spiritual refreshment .
May it be an encouragement to
tread faithfully the narrow way of
sacrifice and suffering even unto
death. If faithful, we shall be with
him in whose presence there is
fulness of joy ; at whose right han d
there are pleasures forevermore.
Part of that joy and pleasure will be
the dispensing of blessings to both
those who are numbered among
the dead and the dying; to usher
in those ages of glory where there
shall be no more death, neither
sorrow nor crying ; neither shall
there be any more pain, for th e
former things are passed away .
Yes, "soon shall restitution glory
bring to earth a blessed rest . " Let
us joyfully labour to speak of that
time of rest that nears, for this is
one way we can assist each other
in making our calling and electio n
sure. May God bless you all !

This is Charles Cornell. I am
very pleased indeed to have this
privilege of sending greetings from
the "Cornell" family to you dear
brethren met in convention a t
Bloomington .

We are thankful to our Heavenly
Father for the opportunities o f
service he has given us this pas t
year of spreading the good news of
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the kingdom, and also of minister-
ing to some of his children. It has
been greatly encouraging to us to
realise that there is still "one here
and one there" who is seeking th e
Lord and who has a desire to know
something of our great Jehovah' s
plan of the ages .

We rejoice in the knowledge tha t
the truths we cherish so dearly ,
that we have learned through our
dear Pastor Russell 's pen, will b e
meditated upon at your convention ,
bringing still new beauties and still
increasing light from the precious
Word of God.

Let us hold fast, that no man
take our crown, treasuring mor e
and more the honour of knowing
Jesus our elder Brother and walk-
ing in his footsteps, until we ar e
made like him.

Our earnest prayer for you all
is that the Lord will bless you
richly in your fellowship together, -
and will "keep love's banner float-
ing o 'er you," that you may con-
tinue along the narrow way and b e
not weary in welldoing, until
such time as he will say, "Well
done, come up higher . "

Pray for us as we pray for you
that we may meet in the great
home gathering beyond the veil.
`Face to face, with Christ my Sav-
iour,"—oh, what rapture will it be !
We shall see him bye and bye .
God bless you all !

My dear brethren whom I lov e
in the truth! This is Brother Mur-
ray.

Two years ago I was with many
of you at conventions ; also in your
local ecclesias, and in your homes .
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For me, they were wonderful
spiritually uplifting experiences ,
for which I shall ever be grateful.

Your continued, joyous zeal an d
enthusiasm for the Lord and for
his glorious cause, are a grea t
stimulus and encouragement to us .

It would seem that years ago
you dear ones were specially
prompted by the Lord to antici-
pate hearing, something like tha t
cry of old from Macedonia : "Come
over and help us . " You have, un-
der divine guidance and blessing,
helped us in a marvelous way ;
also, untold numbers of others i n
many parts of the earth .

You have clearly understood
that the "field " of the parable in
which the "Word" of the kingdom
is to be proclaimed, is the "world" ;
also that "ye are the light of th e
world . " Your glorious theme song,
embodying a fervent prayer, has
been, and still is : "Send Out Thy
Light and Truth, 0 Lord. "

Further, your operative faith and
laborious love have, by the Lord's
grace, urged and enabled you un-
hesitatingly to lay hold upon won-
derful opportunities which could
be yours in the Master's service ,
but only at the cost of self-denia l
and sell-sacrifice .

You have been obedient to the
heavenly vision.

And so today you are valiantly
proclaiming the true Gospel of the
kingdom "world-wide" as never
before, and by various means, in-
cluding one of the great invention s
of our day, the radio, through
which countless millions have the
opportunity of hearing "Frank and

Ernest" and "Russell" every week .
Then there is the printed page ,

the pilgrim service, the tape re-
cordings, etc .

We do rejoice in having abundant
and very encouraging evidence tha t
the various wonderful means you
are using for the proclamation of
the truth are being very richly
blessed by the Lord . And we very
gladly and gratefully co-operate
with you in this grand work. We
ever earnestly pray for you, even
as we do for ourselves, that come
what may, we shall all remain
faithful, standing fast in one spirit ,
with one mind, vigorously co -
operating for the faith of the Gos-
pel .

God bless you all !

Brother Krupa's Discours e
The last talk to the brethren on

Thursday was given by Brothe r
Raymond Krupa, of the New York
Ecclesia . His topic was "Children -
of the Kingdom." When relating
The Parable of the Wheat and the
Tares, Jesus explained that the
"wheat" were "the children of the
kingdom . " They are the "children"
of the kingdom because they ar e
imbued with the hope of the king-
dom, and rejoice in the blessings
which the kingdom Of Christ wil l
dispense to "all the families . of the
earth . "

These "children of the kingdom "
are the sons of God, those who ar e
"heirs of God and joint-heirs wit h
Jesus Christ." They believe th e
promises of God that if they suffer
with Christ they shall also reign
with him. Thus through faith and
the full devotion of themselves to
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the doing of God's will, they be -
come co-workers with him in th e
greatest project of all time, the
work of reconciling the fallen rac e
to God, and restoring all the will-
ing and obedient to life everlasting
on the earth as human beings .

Many business concerns use
trademarks to assist the people in
becoming acquainted with and
readily recognizing their product .
Our "trademark, " as children of
the kingdom—the "little flock" to
whom it is the Father's good pleas-
ure to give the kingdom—is found
in Acts 3 :19-21 . It is in this pas-
sage that the Apostle Peter speaks
of the "times of restitution," which ,
he declares, were spoken by the
mouth of all God 's holy prophets
since the world began .

When this " trademark" is rec-
ognized by the world it will neve r
be forgotten, for it is descriptiv e
of the blessings of life and happi-
ness for which, when received, th e
world will be eternally grateful .
Here at the convention we are a
very happy people, enjoying God's
blessing in rich measure . But if
we close our eyes to our own joy
in the Lord, and look out upon th e
despair of the world, the scene i s
quite different.

There are accidents, the fear of
war, sickness, suffering, and death .
Picture a loving wife standing by
the bedside of her dying husband ,
helpless . Stand at a railway sta-
tion and watch the sorrow of a
father and mother as they say
goodbye to their son who is bein g
taken into the army and perhap s
to death. Follow a young mother,
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holding in her hand a few flowers ,
as she turns into a cemetary to
decorate the grave of her belove d
dead child . Yes, the world is full
of heartaches, and we, the "chil-
dren of the kingdom, " alone kno w
about the divine remedy, and we
are authorized to proclaim it, an d
thus to "comfort all that mourn . "—
Isa . 61 :1-3

In The Parable of the Wheat and
Tares Jesus taught that the "wheat"
and the "tares"—or, as he ex-
plained, the "children of the king-
dom" and the "children of the
wicked one "—would grow to-
gether until the harvest . This
proved to be true. Throughout th e
age prior to the harvest the "chil-
dren of the kingdom" did not stan d
out as a separate group, but even
though surrounded on every sid e
by the "tares, " they were nour-
ished by God.

Now it is harvest time, when w e
should expect that the "wheat "
would be separated from th e
"tares . " And who are the "wheat, "
"the children of the kingdom "?
Surely not those who know noth-
ing of the kingdom. Nor are they
those who, when they hear th e
message of the kingdom, ignore or
oppose it . How few of the great
nominal mass of believers hav e
been inspired by the hope of the
kingdom! Truly, as Jesus said, i t
has been a "little flock . "—Luk e
12 :32

All of Jesus ' parables are related
in one way or another to the king -
dom. Some illustrate the develop-
ment of character which is essential
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for the "children of the kingdom"
if they are to be worthy of reign-
ing with Christ ; others reveal that
Satan would develop a counterfeit
kingdom class, while others sho w
the workings of the kingdom in the
blessing of the people. All of thes e
are important to us as "children of
the kingdom . "

These children of the kingdom
are imbued with the hope of th e
kingdom, and gladly lay dow n
their lives in the work of the king -
dom. Besides, the word "children "
suggests another of their charac-
teristics—they are humble and
teachable . Jesus said, "Except y e
be converted, and become as littl e
children, ye shall not enter into
the kingdom of heaven."—Matt.
18 : 3

One of the greatest joys of the
"children of the kingdom" is to
proclaim the Gospel of the king -
dom. The Psalmist prophesied:
"Thy saints shall bless thee. They
shall speak of the glory of thy
kingdom, and talk of thy power ; to
make known to the sons of men
his mighty acts, and the glorious
majesty of his kingdom . "—Ps. 145 :
10-12

Only those who know the "joyful
sound" of the divine plan of the
ages are able to make known the
greatness of God . Only these ar e
in a position to make known the
"glory" of the divine kingdom soon
to be manifested for the blessing o f
the people. Only those who know
about "restitution " can properly
tell about the mighty power of God
that will be utilized in the resur-
rection of the dead. No greater

48

privilege has ever been given to
any of God's creatures than the
one which we enjoy of proclaiming
the good news of the kingdom !

THE ROUND TABLE
DISCUSSION

THE last session on Thursday
afternoon was a round table dis-
cussion on "Christ ' s Second Pres-
ence . " The participants in this
discussion were Brothers Pante l
Hatgis, Martin C. Mitchell, Felix
S. Wassmann, and Norman Wood-
worth, all of the New York Ec-
clesia . In his introduction Brother
Woodworth quoted a statement b y
Brother Russell which originall y
appeared in his booklet on Christ ' s '
second coming, and now repub-
lished in "Our Most Holy Faith,"
page 92. It reads :

"This doctrine, as a glorious gem ,
should be given the first place
among the precious jewels of di-
vine truth, where it can cast it s
halo and splendor and brillianc y
over all connected and related
promise§ and blessings . It should
not be left in its imperfect setting
which hides its glory and beauty ,
but should be recovered, re-
mounted, set in its true place, to
the glory of God and the blessin g
of all who are sincerely and truly
his people . "

After the brief introduction ,
Brother Mitchell opened the dis-
cussion with a presentation of
scriptural proof that in his resur-
rection Jesus was highly exalted
to the divine nature, hence is n o
longer a man visible to human
eyes. Jesus said that he would



give his flesh for the life of th e
world. He was put to death in th e
flesh, but made alive in the spirit .
Paul wrote concerning the resur-
rected Jesus, saying, "Who only
hath immortality, dwelling in the
light which no man can approach
unto: whom no man hath seen, no r
can see."—I Tim . 6 :1 6

Brother Hatgis asked Brothe r
Mitchell what the angel meant who
said to the apostles at the time o f
Jesus' ascension, "This same Jesus
shall so come in like manner as y e
have seen him go . "—Acts 1 :1 1

Replying, Brother Mitchell ex-
plained that the angel referred t o
the manner of Christ 's return, not
to the nature of Jesus . He was t o
return as he went away, which wa s
quietly, and unknown to any ex-
cept his own disciples. Jesus ex-
perienced a change of nature when
he was "made flesh," but he wa s
the same personality . He contin-
ued to be the same personality—
"this same Jesus "—even though he
had experienced a second change
of nature ; that is, from the human
to the divine.

Brother Wassmann then asked :
"If Jesus is a spirit being since his
resurrection, what did he mean
when he said to his disciples, ` A
spirit hath not flesh and bones as
ye see me have ' ? "

This statement was made by
Jesus, Brother Mitchell explained,
on one of his few appearances t o
his disciples after his resurrection .
In the past angels had appeared in
human form, visible to human
eyes . So Jesus had now appeared,
and he explained to his disciples
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that they need not be afraid, that
what they were seeing was not a
phantom, but a fleshly body in
which he had appeared . To Mary
he had appeared as a gardener ; to
the two disciples on the way to
Emmaus, as a stranger—they di d
not recognize him from his appear-
ance. Referring to another oc-
casion when Jesus appeared to his
disciples in a body of flesh similar
to the one which was crucified,
the Apostle John wrote, "Many
other signs truly did Jesus." (John
20 :30) This implies, Brother Mit-
chell asserted, that the appearanc e
by Jesus in a body of flesh wa s
merely a sign, a miraculous dem-
onstration to prove that he had
been raised from the dead .

Brother Wassmann then set
forth briefly how the fact that
Jesus is now a divine being would
of necessity affect our understand-
ing of our Lord 's return and pres-
ence. Since Jesus is now the
express image of his Father 's per -
son, it means that his presence is
invisible to human eyes, even as th e
Heavenly Father cannot be seen b y
man.

Brother Wassmann referred t o
Jesus' conversation with Nico-
demus as furnishing information
concerning spirit beings. Jesus
said that as the wind blows and
we see the evidence of its power ,
but cannot see the wind itself, " s o
is every one that is born of the
spirit ." Because Jesus' secon d
presence is invisible, he prophesied
that he would return as a "thief
in the night," unknown to the

49



7

THE DAW N

world, and recognized only by his
own people .

Because Jesus knew that his re -
turn would be as a "thief in th e
night," he admonished his disci-
ples tc "watch . " Should he return
in a body of flesh and, as traditio n
teaches . be visible to human eyes
as he descended from the sky, th e
unbelieving world would know of
his coming just as readily as his
own people, hence there would be
no advantage in watching. We do
not watch the sky to see Jesus re -
turn, but the watchers becam e
aware of his presence by watching
the fulfilment of tb ure Word of
prophecy . "

Parousia, Epiphanin, 1-;okalupsis

Brother Hatgis, a native of
Greece, was asked to explain th e
meaning of the three Greek words-
paronsia, epiphanis, and apoka-
lups"s---rinsed in the T'^•.v Testament
prophcci,r s relating to Christ's
second p n esence, whi h he did, i n
a ver s derstandah' way .

The err ek word ' a='oasia means
only presence. Toth r Hatgis as-
serted. He citer' Paul's use of this
word with reference to his own
presence with the brethren -t Co-
rinth. Concerning the brthren's
opinion of himself, Paul wrote ,
"His letters, they say, are weighty
and power ',II ; but his bodily pres-
ence is weak . " (II Col . 10:10 )
Paul also uses the Greek word
parousia in Philippians 2 :12, which
reads, "Wherefore, my beloved, as
ye have always obeyed, not as i n
my presence [parousia] only, but
now much more in my absence ."
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We know what is meant by the
parousia, or presence of a human
being, that it does not mean that he
is coming, or is on the way, but is
actually present. Therefore, when
this word is applied in the prophe-
cies to Jesus' parousia it could
only refer to his presence. Parou-
sia should have been translated
presence in every text in which i t
appears .

The Greek word epiphania, used
in some of the prophecies relating
to Christ's second presence, means
to reveal, or make apparent . The
Greek word apokalupsis has a very
similar meaning, Brother Hatgis
explained . Later in the discus-
sion, and in answer to a question,
Brother Hatgis agreed that, briefly
stated, we could say epiphania
means to reveal by a bright shin-
ing, while apokalupsis means to
reveal by means of an uncovering ,
or unveiling .

In response to further question-
ing Brother Hatgis said that th e
element of time is not in any way
implied by either of these two
Greek words ; they do not, that is,
describe periods of time . Time is
involved in the prophecies in
which these words are used only
in the sense that the presence o f
Christ is first revealed to th e
church, and later to the world . It
was because of the bright shining
and the uncovering of Christ's
presence soon after he returned
that the "watchers" became aware
of this great event in the plan o f
God. To the world he is still pres-
ent as a " thief in the night . " Some
of the prophecies reveal that when



Christ's presence is uncovered t o
the world the church will be re-
vealed with him in glory .

In answer to a question by
Brother Wassmann, Brother Hatgis
explained that a proper under -
standing of the word parousia
means that all the signs which h e
gave in answer to the question b y
his disciples, "What shall be th e
sign of thy coming [parousia] ?" ar e
seen to be signs, not that his com-
ing would be near, but that his
presence had become a reality .—
Matt . 24 : 3

Some of the Sign s

As the dicsussion continue d
Brother Mitchell called attention
to a number of the "signs" which
to the "watchers" are sure token s
of Christ' s second presence. Jesus
said, quoting from the prophecy of
Daniel, that there would be a tim e
of "great tribulation," tribulation
so severe, that unless the troubl e
were shortened no flesh would be
saved. (Dan. 12 :1-4; Matt. 24:21,
22) This "sign" is now very ap-
parent.

Associated with Daniel ' s proph-
ecy concerning the great "tribula-
tion," or "trouble, " that would
result from the "standing up" of
Michael (Jesus at his second ad -
vent) is the prophecy concernin g
an increase of knowledge and much
running to and fro . Today we see
this prophecy fulfilled to a remark-
able degree.

Replying to another question
Brother Mitchell affirmed that
present developments in Palestin e
are strong evidences of Christ' s
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second presence. He referred to
the sign mentioned by Jesus con-
cerning the "fig tree" putting forth
its leaves, which, as we know, re-
fers to the revival of life in the
Jewish nation . This also, Jesus
said, was to be one of the signs o f
his presence, and we are seeing a
beginning of its fulfilment .—Matt .
24 :32

One of the signs of Christ' s
presence which is greatly appre-
ciated by the "watchers " is the ful-
filment of Jesus' own promise to
gird himself and serve his house-
hold with "meat in due season . "
(Luke 12:37) We are enjoying the
light of present truth today be-
cause this prophecy, or promise ,
has been fulfilled. This promise
also reveals that Jesus would be
present with his people while they
were still in the flesh, and .when
they would need the "meat in du e
season, " the glorious doctrines of
present truth, to nourish and sus-
tain them .

All the doctrines of the divin e
plan have been clarified as a resul t
of our Lord 's return. Basic to all o f
them, of course, is the doctrin e
of the ransom, which could not b e
properly understood until the doc-
trines dependent upon it wer e
clarified . There was one doctrine ,
however, which had been lost al -
together; that is, the doctrine of
"restitution . " It is this preciou s
doctrine, testified by all God ' s holy
prophets, that gives real meanin g
to every other feature of the di -
vine plan.—Acts 3 :19-21

The doctrine of "restitution, " it
was brcught out, became the "hall
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mark" of the truth movement. We
have been accused of teaching a
"second chance" because we have
had revealed to us by the returne d
Lord the glorious fact that "times
of restittuion of all things " is the
only logical, and the necessary re-
sult of, the ransom. And this doc-
trine, in a very special sense, is
meat in "due season," for we are
now entering the restitution age .
It is already time to announce the
hope of restitution for the world ,
and soon it will be time for the ac-
tual work of restitution to begin .

Even the instrumentality through
which our returned Lord has re-
vealed the truth to his people i s
one of the signs of his presence .
In Luke 12 :41-44 and Matthe w
24 :45-47, Jesus spoke of a "serv-
ant" whom he would use for thi s
purpose. There is every reason t o
believe, as revealed by the circum-
stances involved, that Brothe r
Russell was "that servant . "

More About Bright Shining
In answer to another questio n

Brother Wassmann explained that
while the world is still in igno-
rance of the Master's presence, the
bright shining of his parousia is
having a tremendous effect upon
the world and its ways. He cited
the increase of knowledge through -
out the earth, and the manner in
which it is breaking down super-
stition, and consequently under-
mining the foundation of the
various institutions of earth whic h
are built upon ignorance and su-
perstition.

Brother Wassmann also referred

to the manner in which labor-sav-
ing machinery is gradually setting
aside the "curse" of hard labor im-
posed upon the human race be -
cause of adamic sin . Wonderful
progress has also been made in the
field of medical science, resultin g
in a great increase of the average
length of human life .

Man, of course, will not be able
to extricate himself from the sen-
tence of death, but, because we ar e
living in the early beginning of the
Millennium, God is permitting man
to discover ways and means of
helping himself up to a point. In
this "day of preparation," for in -
stance, the development of labor -
saving machinery might well be,
for one thing, to make possible the
providing of the needs of the mil -
lions upon millions whom we kno w
are to be raised from the dead . All
these will need homes and cloth-
ing .

Because of human selfishness the
great advantages of today are no t
making the people more contented ,
but otherwise . Strife and war are
being fomented, which, in fulfil-
ment of one of the prophetic
"signs" of the Master's presence ,
are causing a "time of trouble such
as never was since there was a
nation. "

In reply to another question
Brother Wassmann explained tha t
the words parousia and epiphani a
were both used in II Thessalonians
2 :8. In this text Paul is speakin g
of the "man of sin, " the great Anti-
christ which would be develope d
during the Gospel age. Then he
says concerning this system o f

52



iniquity, "Whom the Lord shal l
consume with the spirit of hi s
mouth, and shall destroy with the
brightness [epiphania] of his com-
ing [parousia] . "

Already we see the beginning o f
the fulfilment of this prophecy .
The bright shining, the "increase
of knowledge, " resulting from the
parousia of the Lord is breaking
down superstition in the minds of
millions, and releasing them from
bondage to the papal Antichrist.
Millions right in Italy now dare to
vote against their former Master,
the Church of Rome .

In answer to a further question
Brother Wassmann explained tha t
the bright shining of Christ ' s pres-
ence was as yet only in its begin-
ning stage; that it would continue
to enlighten the minds of the peo-
ple along all lines . And even more
important, eventually it will cause
the knowledge of the Lord to fil l
the earth as the waters cover the
sea . But we need not wait for thi s
glorious sign before we accept th e
fact of the Master ' s presence.

Time Prophecies
Brother Hatgis gave a brief out -

line of some of the time prophecies
related to our Lord 's second pres-
ence, particularly "the times of the
Gentiles . " Jesus said that "Jeru-
salem shall be trodden down of the
Gentiles until the times of th e
Gentiles shall be fulfilled." (Luke
21:24) The student is referred to
"Studies in the Scriptures" for de-
tails of this and other time prophe-
cies, but briefly stated, as brough t
out by Brother Hatgis, the "times
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of the Gentiles" is a fixed period
of time" of 2,520 years, beginning
in 606 B. C., and ending A. D. 1914.

It was in 606 B. C. that the Jew-
ish people lost their national inde-
pendence . Their government was
overthrown and the people taken
captive to Babylon. Here the Gen-
tiles were permitted to exercis e
dominion over them, and this was
to continue for 2,520 years, or until
A. D. 1914. This is not a period o f
time to which the existence o f
Gentile nations would be confined ,
but one during which they woul d
be permitted to rule over the Jew-
ish people .

Time prophecies pinpoint, no t
the completion of events to which
they refer, but their small begin-
nings. It was as a direct result of
the first World War which began in
1914 that the Jews were permitted
to return to the Promised Land
which, in turn, and in the provi-
dence, of God, eventually led t o
their independence as a people .
This was in 1948, when the new
Jewish State was born .

Now they are a nation among
nations . True, they have muc h
"distress" and trouble, but so d o
all the other nations of earth . As
a sign of his presence Jesus did not
say that the Jewish people would
all turn to him, accept Jesus a s
their Messiah, and experienc e
restitution blessings, immediately
upon the end of the "times of the
Gentiles . " All that he said was
that they would no longer be a
vassal nation, no longer withou t
national independence . This sign ,
therefore, we have seen fulfilled,



THE DAWN

and it becomes another evidence of
the Master's second presence .

In summing up, Brother Wood -
worth referred to the 1,335 days of
Daniel 12 and other time prophe-
cies, which serve to confirm th e
fact of Christ's second presence.
And, as he said, all of these point s
of truth are important to us, fo r
the fact that we see "these things"
coming to pass causes us to "look
up," and to "lift up" our heads ,
knowing that our deliverance
"draweth nigh."—Luke 21 :28

THE LAST DA Y
THE convention ended at noon

on Friday, August 5, the last ses-
sion, like the others, being one of
rejoicing in the Lord . Brother D .
J . Morehouse, of Chicago, Illinois ,
served as chairman . The text fo r
the day was Luke 24:32—"Did not
our hearts burn within us? " These
are the words of the disciples with
whom the resurrected Jesus con -
versed on the road to Emmaus .
Their hearts burned as Jesus
opened to them the Scriptures an d
showed that it was necessary fo r
the Christ to suffer and die as th e
Redeemer and Savior of the world .

For six days at Bloomington, th e
Lord, through his various servants ,
had been opening up his precious
Word to the brethren, and like th e
disciples of old, their hearts burne d
within them as old and establishe d
truths were reaffirmed, and a
deeper insight into various aspects
of the divine plan was obtained .
Six brethren had been given the
responsibility of reviewing the
blessings of the week, each one be-
ing assigned a particular day.
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Brother G. A. Ford, of England ,
vividly recalled many of the bless-
ings received on the opening day.
Then Brother W. H. Ellis, of the
Cincinnati, Ohio, Ecclesia, told o f
the joys which made the hearts of
the brethren burn on Sunday.
Brother Andrew Horwood, of St.
John's, Newfoundland, reviewed
Monday's program, and told of th e
things which on that day cause d
his heart to burn. Tuesday's ses-
sions were reviewed by Brother
Ludlow P. Loomis, of the New
York Ecclesia . He reminded the
brethren especially of the radi o
report, and of the prospects of
continuing the witness for another
year. Brother Lyle Cook, of Kan-
sas City, Missouri, recalled some o f
the blessings enjoyed on Wednes-
day, speaking of the joy that filled
his heart as he saw the newly con-
secrated indicated their desire t o
symbolize the immersion of their
wills into the will of God in Christ .
Brother Kenneth Rawson, of th e
New Brunswick, New Jersey, Ec-
clesia recalled many of the bless-
ings which caused the hearts of the
brethren to burn on Thursday .
Brother Rawson made special men-
tion of the public meeting, and told
of the great joy of the brethren a s
once more they heard the Gospe l
of the kingdom proclaimed .

Following this recalling of con-
vention joys there was the usua l
"love feast " at which the brethren
said their goodbyes, and sang "God
Be with You ' Til We Meet Again, "
and other appropriate hymns. It
was a joyful gathering, in which
those long in the truth mingled



with and enjoyed the fellowship o f
new brethren, many of whom ha d
first heard the truth over the radio .
The presence of these at the con-
vention was a sure token that th e
brethren's sponsorship of the radio
work had borne rich fruit .

MISCELLANEOUS
CONVENTION ITEMS

THE convention public meetin g
was addressed by Brother Russel l
Pollock, of Los Angeles, California .
His topic was "Today, Tomor-
row in Prophecy . " Brother Pol-
lock's discourse appears in the
Highlights of Dawn Department, in
this issue of The Dawn.

An additional witness was given
over WTTS, the local radio station .
There were two fifteen minute
programs in which "Frank and
Ernest" interviewed Brother Pol-
lock concerning his visit to Pales -
tine and Europe. By tape recording
Brother Pollock's public discours e
was also broadcast over WTTS.
An excellent report of the publi c
talk appeared in the universit y
daily paper.

The radio station also broadcas t
a ten minute lecture on the truth
at 7:35 A. M., Monday through
Friday. These short discourses
were given by Brothers E. K. Pen-
rose, Columbus, Ohio; Adolph
Obenland, Miami, Florida ; Fred
Mundell, Brooklyn, New York ; Le-
land Parsons, Salem, Oregon ; and
William Pardue, St . Louis, Mis-
souri .

Brother Pollock gave a very in-
spiring report of his visit to Pales -
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tine and his experiences with the
brethren in various European
countries . A complete transcrip t
of this is being prepared, and will ,
the Lord willing, appear in the
October issue of The Dawn .

At the convention business meet-
ing it was voted to accept the uni-
versity 's invitation to return to
Bloomington for the 1956 General
Convention. The 1956 convention
will begin on Saturday, August 4 ,
and end on Friday, August 10 .

A motion was passed at the busi-
ness meeting to extend the Chris-
tian love and greetings of the
convention to the Lord 's pecple in
every country, making this mes-
sage known as widely as possible .
The convention secretary will com-
municate this message to many in
overseas countries, and we are
happy to use the columns of The
Dawn to extend these greetings to
still others.

Messages of Christian love an d
greetings were sent to the conven-
tion by air mail, telegrams, and
cables from many parts of th e
world. In addition to those re-
ceived from ecclesias and individ-
uals in the United States and
Canada, greetings were received
from Great Britain, Denmark, Ger-
many, France, Switzerland, Italy ,
Greece, and India . The brethren
at the convention thrilled as these
messages were read from the plat-
form, emphasizing as they did that
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the Lord's people in so many part s
of the world were at the conven-
tion in spirit, thinking of and
praying for the brethren there
assembled .

Another feature of the conven-
tion was that all the discourses and
testimonies were recorded on tape ,
not merely by one recorder, but by
thirty-six . Many, even at the con-
vention, did not realize that thi s
was being done, for the recorder s
were located in a room separated
from the auditorium . These re-

cordings will extend the blessings
of the convention to many hun-
dreds who were not able to attend .
They will be used in home ec-
clesias, taken to the isolated and to
shut-ins . Many of them will be
used over and over again .

Incidentally, we remind the
brethren again of the Dawn Re -
corded Lecture Service. These are
sent free to those who reques t
them. Recorded lectures are avail -
able which are suitable for the
brethren, and you may also obtain
public lectures . Write for further
details.

Be not men 's servant : think what costly pric e
Was paid that thou might His own bondsman be ,

Whose service perfect freedom is . Let this

Hold fast thy heart . His claim is great to thee.
All His are thine to serve : Christ's brethren here

Are needing aid; in them thou servest Him .

The least of all is still His member dear ,
The weakest cost His lifeblood to redeem.

SEPTEMBER 1—"But the Lord sai d
unto him, Go thy way: for he is a
chosen vessel unto me, to bear my
name before the Gentiles, and kings ,
and the children of Israel."—Acts 9 :15
(Z . '03-206 . Hymn 269 )

SEPTEMBER 8—"Know ye not that th e
friendship of the world is enmity with
God? Whosoever therefore will be a
friend of the world is the enemy of
God."—James 4:4 (Z. '99-70 . Hymn 312)

SEPTEMBER 15—"Come out fro m
among them, and be ye separate, saith

the Lord, and touch not the unclean
thing ; and I will receive you ."—II Co-
rinthians 6 :17 (Z . '99-203. Hymn 134)

SEPTEMBER 22—"Surely goodness an d
mercy shall follow me all the days of
my life ; and I will dwell in the house
of the Lord forever ."—Psalm 23 :6 (Z .
'03-413. Hymn 286 )

SEPTEMBER 29—"Every one that is
proud in heart is an abomination to
the Lord ."—Prov . 16 :5 (Z . '03-329 . Hymn
130)
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Radio Report and Resolutio n

THE customary radio report was presented to the convention a t
the Tuesday evening session, together with a recommendatio n

from the elders meeting at the convention, which had been decided
upon the night before. The report was not in the same detail as i n
previous years, but it was nevertheless encouraging.

It was explained that the mail response to the "Frank and
Ernest" broadcasts averaged slightly below that of the year before .
There are various reasons for this . First, the number of stations
carrying the message was somewhat reduced at the beginning o f
the contract year, and this, of course, would reduce the number of
responses . And then, it was noted, television has claimed a certain
percentage of the radio audience, although this is not so much so on
Sunday mornings as at other times .

The third reason given for the reduced number of response s
was the fact that we have been using the same stations for nearly
four years, with the result that there are very few new listeners .
On the other hand, it was reported that the present year has wit-
nessed a deeper degree of interest on the part of many listeners than
previously, which, of course, is the main result which we are
seeking.

Because we have used the Mutual Network for nearly four years ,
consideration was given by the elders to the advisability of changin g
to the ABC Network. Letters which were sent to the secretaries
of the ecclesias prior to the convention had acquainted many of th e
brethren with the fact that the ABC Network is available, although
probably at an increased cost of approximately twenty percent .

Since, as reported to the convention, the present cost of the radi o
work has been, during the present year, just about equal to th e
donations, serious consideration was given to the matter of making
a change that would involve increased costs. The ecclesias respond-
ing to the letter sent to them concerning this indicated in thei r
replies that they had taken this factor into consideration, and th e
vast majority voted in favor of the change . A small number of the
eccelsias wrote that they were quite willing to let the matter b e
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decided at the convention, and would heartily co-operate in what -
ever decision was made .

This response from the ecclesias was reported to the elders, and
after due consideration they voted to recommend to the conventio n
that a resolution be passed favoring the use of the ABC Network,
beginning with the new contract year in October. Such a resolution
was adopted by the convention, but leaving it to the discretion o f
the brethren at The Dawn not to make the change should unfore-
seen factors arise in negotiations which would make it unwise t o
do so .

The convention also voted to take up "Good Hopes" pledges ,
which was done . And in harmony with the custom of previou s
years, we are giving all the brethren the opportunity thus to indi-
cate the extent to which they hope to be able to support this new
effort on the ABC Network. In keeping with this, and for your con-
venience, on the bottom of page 64 of this issue of The Dawn a
"Good Hopes" coupon will be found . Your "Good Hopes" is not a
binding pledge, but simply an expression of what you reasonabl y
hope to be able to donate toward the radio work. An early receipt
of these "Good Hopes" coupons will be an aid to us in connection
with the proposed new contract .

Foreign Broadcasts
The convention radio report included the foreign broadcasts, in

the English, French, Italian, German, and Spanish languages ; the
latter having only recently begun. The English-language program s
continue to be broadcast over Radio Luxembourg, and also Radi o
Laurenco Marques, in South Africa. Letters recently received
from South Africa indicate that some of the listeners have actually
embraced present truth, and are rejoicing in it as a result of first
hearing the message over the radio . There is also a great deal of
new interest in the British Isles resulting from the English-languag e
broadcasts over Radio Luxembourg.

The same encouraging results can be reported concerning the
German, Italian, and French-language programs being broadcas t
over Radio Luxembourg and Radio Monte Carlo . All the foreign
broadcasts are paid for from the "Good Hopes" of the American
brethren in the United States and Canada. Our overseas brethren
would gladly help all they could, but the broadcasting companie s
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will not accept anything but American dollars in payment for the
broadcasts, and in this unstable world Swiss currency is the only

currency which can be converted into American dollars for broad-
casting purposes .

The Spanish-language broadcasts are just beginning . Time alone

will tell the result of these. They are currently being heard over

Radio International Tangiers, a small chain of stations in the Canal
Zone bordering on Central America, and over a powerful station o n

the border of Uraguay which reaches all of Argentina . Many other
opportunities are open for the Spanish-language programs, and w e

are leaving it in the Lord's hands as to the extent they can be used .

Let us pray that the Lord will direct with respect to all of his work .

There are great truths that pitch their shining tents

Outside our walls, and though but dimly see n

In the gray dawn, they will be manifes t

When the light widens into perfect day .

N,

HEAR . . .

"FRANK AND ERNEST "
DISCUSS

"HELL GIVES UP ITS DEAD"

WOR SUNDAY, SEPTEMBER 18, 195 5
710 kc., 8 :45 A. M .

Do you know that those who go to
the Bible hell do not necessaril y
remain there? Send for a free copy
of the bookle t
"The Revelation of Jesus Christ "

"FRANK AND ERNEST"
Box 60, Dept. N, General Post Office

NEW YORK, N . Y .

For Your Newspape r
To the left is a suggestion for a small

advertisement in your local newspaper .
The outline is designed for two inche s
in one column .

OCTOBER TOPIC: The "Frank an d
Ernest" topic to be specially advertised
in October is "God's Plan of the Ages ."
This topic will be used on Sunday,
October 18 . Circulars advertising thi s
program will be available, but place
your order as early as possible. In all
probability a different station in your
district will be carrying the program ,
but this need not delay your order for
the circulars, as the brethren in Th e
Dawn office will have this needed in -
formation.
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(Continued on page 63 )

"FRANK AND ERNEST" BROADCAST S
"Radio Luxembourg "

Mondays, 11 :15 P . M .—208 Meters, 1439 kc .

AVAILABLE IN GREAT BRITAI N
STUDIES IN THE SCRIPTURES—Full Set of Si x
Volumes, 18/ 9
Volumes 1, 2, and 3—2/6 each ; paper
bound, Vol . 1 only—1/3
Volumes 4, 5, and 6—3/9 eac h
Berean Question Books—For Volume 1, 6d ; 2,
6d ; 3, 6d ; 4, 8d ; 5, 8d ; 6, 8d .

Free Literatur e
"Frank and Ernest" Announcement Cards fo r
Radio Luxembourg . Order as many as yo u
can use .

ONEPENNY BOOKLETS
Divine Intervention Near; The Judgment Day ;
God's Remedy for a World Gone Mod .

THREEPENNY BOOKLETS—2/6 per doze n
Spiritualism; Jesus, the World's Savior; Hop e
for a Fear-filled World ; Father, Son, and
Holy Spirit ; Armageddon; Does God Answe r
Prayer?; Your Adversary the Devil; The Ligh t
of the World; The Church ; Born of the Spirit;

What Can a Man Believe?; The Blood of th e
Atonement ; Divine Healing .

SIX PENNY BOOKLET S
Our Lord 's Return ; God 's Plan ; The Trut h
About Hell ; God and Reason ; Hope Beyond
the Grave; Creation ; A Royal Nation ; Chose n
People; When a Man Dies.

MISCELLANEOUS PUBLICATIONS
"Behold Your King" (Cloth)—2/6 ; (Paper) —
1/ 3
Daily Heavenly Manna—(Cloth)—2/6 ; (de
I uxe)—6/ 3
Hymns of Dawn (Cloth)—5/- each ; without
music, 1/ 3
Tabernacle Shadows (Cloth)—2/6 eac h
The Everlasting Gospel—8d each ; 7/6 pe r
doze n
Hope (Consolation booklet)—1/2 a doze n
"Songs in the Night"—2/ 6
Our Most Holy Faith—10 /
God's Promises Come True—10 /
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SPEAKERS` APPOINTMENT S

SAMUEL BAKER
Parkers Prairie, Minn . . . . September

	

1, 2
Minneapolis, Minn	 3-5
Elkader, Iowa	 7, 8
Clinton, Iowa	 9, 1 1
Barnes City, Iowa	 12, 1 3
Lincoln, Neb	 14, 1 5
St . Joseph, Mo	 1 6
Kansas City, Mo	 18-20
Topeka, Kans .

	

2 1
Wichita, Kans	 22,23
Carthage, Mo	 25
Galena, Kans	 26
Fredonia, Kans	 27,28
Springfield, Mo	 29
St . Louis, Mo	 October

	

1, 2
WILLIAM A. BAKER

Seattle, Wash	 September

	

3-5
WILLIAM T. BAKER

Minneapolis, Minn	 September

	

3-5
JULIUS BEDNARZ

Minneapolis, Minn	 September

	

3-5
WALTER BLICHARZ, JR .

London, Ont. Can	 September

	

1 1
FRED A . BRIGHT

Easton, Pa	 September

	

1 8
EUGENE BURN S

Brooklyn, N . Y	 September

	

3- 5
Pottstown, Pa	 2 5

C. G . CHEESEMAN
Pittsburgh, Pa	 September

	

2 5
BERTRAM COOPER

San Diego, Calif 	 September

	

3-5
JENS COPELAN D

Vancouver, B . C	 September

	

1
Seattle, Wash	 3- 5
Portland, Ore	 6
San Francisco, Calif 	 8
Los Angeles, Calif	 1 1
Glendale, Calif 	 1 3
Long Beach, Calif	 1 4
El Monte, Calif	 1 6
Santa Ana, Calif . (Morning)	 1 8
Los Angeles, Calif . (Evening)	 1 8
Phoenix, Ariz	 20
Tucson, Ariz	 2 1
Topeka, Kans	 2 3
Kansas City, Mo	 2 5

L. PAUL DAVI S
San Diego, Calif	 September

	

3- 5
RUSSELL DEAN

Allentown, Pa	 September

	

25

61

ORLANDO D . DEIFER
Brooklyn, N . Y	 September

	

3-5
North Brookfield, Mass	 1 8

EDWARD E. FAY
Whittier, Calif	 September

	

1 8
IRVING C. FOSS

San Diego, Calif	 September

	

3-5
EARL L . FOWLE R

Sacramento, Calif 	 September

	

1 1
GEORGE A. GIL L

Brooklyn, N . Y	 September

	

3-5

TED HACK
Gary, Ind	 September

	

1 8
E. HARRY HERRSCHE R

San Diego, Calif	 September

	

3-5
EMILE H . HERRSCHE R

San Diego, Calif	 September

	

3-5
WILLIAM J . HOLLISTE R

St . Albans, L. I ., N . Y	 September

	

1
Brooklyn, N . Y	 3-5
Rutherford, N. J	 7
Boston, Mass	 1 1
New Bedford, Mass	 1 4
Paterson, N . J	 1 8
Dayton, Ohio	 2 5

JOHN HUL L
San Diego, Calif	 September

	

3-5
JOHN G . HULL, JR .

Santa Ana, Calif	 September

	

2 5
CHARLES W	 JANK E

Brooklyn, N . Y	 September

	

3-5
STANLEY W . JEUC K

Brooklyn, N . Y	 September

	

3- 5
EDMUND M . JEZUI T

Aurora, III	 September

	

1 1
GILBERT E. KEMP

Brooklyn, N . Y	 September

	

3-5
PETER KOLLIMA N

New Brunswick, N . J	 September

	

2
Waterbury, Conn	 6, 7
New Haven, Conn	 8
New London, Conn	 9
Springfield, Mass	 1 0
Albany, N . Y	 1 1
Syracuse, N . Y	 1 4
Wilkes-Barre, Pa	 1 6

ARTHUR H . KRUMPOL T
Catawissa, Pa	 September

	

1 8
RAYMOND J . KRUP A

North Brookfield, Mass	 September

	

18



THE DAWN
C . STUART LIVERMOR E

Brooklyn, N . Y	 Septembe r
New Brunswick, N . J	

LUDLOW P . LOOMI S
Wallingford, Conn . (Morn .) September
Bridgeport, Conn . (Afternoon)	
Agawam, Mass	

EDWARD LOREN Z
San Diego, Calif	 September

JOHN Y . MAC AULAY
Grand Rapids, Mich	 September
Saginaw, Mich	
Flint, Mich	
Detroit, Mich	
Jackson, Mich	
Adrian, Mich	
Toledo, Ohio	
Elyria, Ohio	
Cleveland, Ohio	
Columbus, Ohio	
Dayton, Ohio	
Piqua, Ohio	
Muncie, Ind	
Indianapolis, Ind	
St . Louis, Mo	 Octobe r

ADAM MISKAWITZ
Seattle, Wash	 September
Vancouver, B . C. Can	
Portland, Oreg	
Milwaukee, Wis	

MARTIN C . MITCHELL
Paterson, N . J	 Septembe r
Reading, Pa

	

	
N . MOLENAA R

San Diego, Calif	 Septembe r
DANIEL J . MOREHOUS E

Minneapolis, Minn	 Septembe r
Covert, Mich

	

	
EVERETT MURRA Y

Columbus, Ohio	 Septembe r
Brooklyn, N . Y	

LEON H . NORBY
Wilmington, Del . (Morn .) September
Philadelphia, Pa . (Afternoon)	

ADOLPH OBENLAN D
Brooklyn, N . Y	 September

HOWARD W. OSTRANDE R
San Diego, Calif	 Septembe r

HARRY PASSIO S
Duquesne, Pa	 Septembe r
Monessen, Pa	

G . RUSSELL POLLOCK
San Diego, Calif	 Septembe r

KENNETH W . RAWSON
Baltimore, Md	 Septembe r

FRED W. RICE
San Diego, Calif	 September

3-5
6
7

9, 1 1
1 2

13, 1 4
15, 1 6

1 8
19,2 0

2 1
22, 2 3
25-2 7

2 8
1, 2

3-5
6
7

1 1

3-5

3- 5
1 8

1
3-5

1 1
1 1

3-5

3-5

4
2 5

3-5

11
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Riverside, Calif. (Morning)	 1 8
3-5

	

Pomona, Calif . (Afternoon)	 1 8
18

	

NORMAN F. RIC E
San Diego, Calif .

	

. September

	

3-5
11

	

San Luis Obispo, Calif 	 1 8
11

	

GEORGE P . RIPPE R
25

	

San Diego, Calif	 September

	

3-5
BERT ROS E

3-5

	

Brooklyn, N . Y	 September

	

3-5
VICTOR E . SAMUEL S

Brooklyn, N . Y	 September

	

3-5
ALFRED L. SMIT H

Brooklyn, N . Y	 September

	

3- 5
MICHAEL A . STAMULA S

Mahanoy City, Pa	 September

	

1 1
W . STROMBERG

La Salle, III	 September

	

1 8
AUGUST SWANSO N

Ostrander, Minn	 September

	

1
Minneapolis, Minn	 3-5
Withee, Wis	 6-8
Wausau, Wis	 9
Appleton, Wis	 1 1
Kenosha, Wis	 1 2
South Milwaukee, Wis 	 1 3
Milwaukee, Wis	 1 4
Rockford, III	 1 5
Albany, III	 1 6
Clinton, Iowa	 1 8
La Salle, III	 19,20
Aurora, III	 2 1

11

	

Gary, Ind	 22, 2 3
18

	

Chicago, III 	 2 5
Champaign, Ill	 2 6
Mattoon, I Il	 27,2 8
West Frankfort, III 	 2 9
St. Louis, Mo	 October

	

1, 2
J . I . VAN HORN E

East Liverpool, Ohio . . . . September

	

1 1
FELIX S . WASSMANN

York, Pa . (Morning) . . . September

	

1 8
Lancaster, Pa . (Afternoon)	 1 8

CLAUDE R. WEID A
Brooklyn, N . Y	 September

	

3-5
Washington, D . C	 25

GEORGE M . WILSO N
Saginaw, Mich	 September

	

3-5
ERNEST G . WYLA M

Wallingford, Conn	 September

	

1
Brooklyn, N . Y	 3-5
Ebensburg, Pa	 6
Steubenville, Ohio	 8
Columbus, Ohio	 8

CHRISTIAN W . ZAHNOW
Los Angeles, Calif. (S. W.) September

	

1
Santa Ana, Calif	 2
San Diego, Calif	 3-5

3-5

	

Riverside, Calif	 6



CHRISTIAN W. ZAHNOW (Continued)
Pomona, Calif 	 7
San Fernando, Calif	 8
Long Beach, Calif	 9
Los Angeles, Calif	 1 1
Los Angeles, Calif . (116th Street) 	 1 3
El Monte, Calif 	 1 4
San Luis Obispo, Calif	 1 5
Fresno, Calif	 16, 1 8
Stockton, Calif	 19,2 0
S onora, Calif	 2 1
San Jose, Calif	 22,2 3
San Francisco, Calif 	 2 5
Sacramento, Calif 	 26, 2 7
Fallon, Nev	 28,29
Chico, Calif	 October

	

1, 2

BRITISH SPEAKERS & CONVENTIO N
(Continued from page 60)

W. E . PAMPLIN G
Ipswich	 September

	

1 8
Dewsbury	 24/25
Eastleigh	 October

	

9
Coventry	 2 3

NOTE : Meetings in Caxton Hall, close to St .
Jame's Park Undergound Station on Satur-
day, September 3, afternoon and evening .

CONVENTION at Dewbury, Sept . 24/26 .
Sat. and Sun . meetings in Central Libera l
Club, Bond St . On Mon . in the Bible Stu -
dents Room 10, Nelson Street . Write Mr.
Boyce, 491, Wayside, Leeds Road, Dewsbury .

SPEAKERS' APPOINTMENTS
CONVENTIONS

(Continued from page 64)

CHICAGO, ILLINOIS, September 25—Open s
10 :00 a .m . in Central Masonic Temple, 91 2
N . LaSalle Street.
DETROIT, MICH ., September 25—Maccabees
Building, Woodward Avenue at Putnam .
BUFFALO, N . Y., October 1, 2—This gather-
ing will be held in the Delta Temple, 692 E .
Utica Street. Room reservations and other
details may be obtained by writing th e
secretary, Mrs . Helen Szuba, 32 South Union
Road, Williamsville 21, New York .
MONESSEN, PA ., September 25—Conventio n
opens at 9 :30 a . m. in the Pythian Center
Hall, 580 Schoonmaker Avenue. Lunch wil l
be served . Other details may be obtaine d
by writing the secretary, Mr . Joseph Fenchak,
Jr ., 573 Conrad Ave ., North Charleroi, Pa .

ST. LOUIS, MO., October 1, 2—For detail s
and other information, write the secretary ,
Mr . E . L . Wagner, 7308 Wellington Ave ., St .
Louis 14, Mo.
PERU, ILL ., October 2—The LaSalle Ecclesi a
is planning this convention to be held i n
the K . of P. Hall, 1711 Fourth St . For othe r
details, write the secretary, Mr . Harol d
Priebe, 1518 Argyle Road, La Salle, Ill .
GRAND RAPIDS, MICH ., October 15, 16 .
ONTARIO, CALIF ., October 16 .

ORLANDO, FLA ., October 30 .
PITTSBURGH, PA ., October 30 .

"GOOD HOPES" COUPO N

FOR

NETWORK AND FOREIG N

BROADCASTS



CONVENTION S

BROOKLYN, N . Y ., September 3-5—Conven-
tion sessions will be held in the Churc h
Auditorium, 104 Clark Street. For reserva-
tions, write the secretary, Mr. Russell Dean,
68 Middagh Street, Brooklyn 2, N . Y.
MINNEAPOLIS, MINN ., September 3-5—Fo r
reservations and other details, address the
secretary, Mrs . Charles R . Newham, 678
40th Avenue, N . E ., Minneapolis 21, Minn .
SAGINAW, MICH ., September 3-5—Conven-
tion opens 3 :00 p. m . Saturday in Y . W. C . A.
Building, 215 S. Jefferson Street . Roo m
reservations and other details may be ob-
tained by writing the secretary, Mrs. C . A.
Sundbom, 207 Alice Street, Saginaw, Mich .
SAN DIEGO, CALIF ., September 3-5—Con-
vention will be held in the Temple Bet h
Israel, 2512 Third Avenue. Room reserva-
tions and other details may be obtained by
writing the secretary, Mrs . Gilbert Rice,
8775 Troy Street, Spring Valley, Calif .
SEATTLE, WASH ., September 3-5—Conventio n
will be held in the Norway Center, 30 0
Third Avenue, West. A baptismal service i s
being arranged . Details and room reserva-
tions may be addressed to Mrs . F. French ,
2821 W . 63rd Street, Seattle 7, Wash .

ALBANY, ORE ., September 4—3596 Bernar d
Street .
ALBANY, N . Y ., September 11—Y . W. C . A .
Building, 5 Lodge Street .
COLUMBUS, OHIO, September 11—Conven-
tion opens 10 :00 a . m. in the Women' s
Benefit Association, 53 E. Gay Street .
LOS ANGELES, CALIF., September 11—Open s
10 :00 o'clock in Foresters' Hall, 1329 Sout h
Hope Street. Special one-day conventio n
with two visiting pilgrims .
CLEVELAND, OHIO, September 18—Conven-
tion opens 9 :30 a . m. in the Y. M. C. A.
Building, Prospect Avenue and East 22nd St .
COVERT, MICH ., September 18—Details re-
garding this convention can be obtained by
writing the secretary, Mrs . Jean Klysek ,
R . F . D . 2, Box 285, Benton Harbor, Mich .
NORTH BROOKFIELD, MASS ., Septembe r
18—Convention opens 9 :30 a .m . in the
Grange Hall, on Main Street . Lunch will b e
served in the hall .
SALEM, ORE., September 18—Conventio n
opens 11 :00 a .m . at 2339 State Street.

(Continued on page 63)

. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .

"GOOD HOPES" COUPON

The Dawn, Radio Dept.
East Rutherford, N . J .

	

Date

Dear Brethren :

I heartily concur in the decision of those gathered at the General Conventio n
to continue the "Frank and Ernest" programs on a network basis for anothe r
year, and on as many stations in Canada and other countries as possible .
After prayerful consideration I believe I will be able to contribute $
a month toward this work of proclaiming the truth .

Name

Address



PUBLICATION S

BIBLE PROPHECY GROU P
Armageddon—32 pages, 5 cents .
Hope for a Fear-filled World—32 pages, 5 cts .
Our Lord 's Return—48 pages, 10 cents .
A Royal Nation—32 pages, 10 cents .
Gcd and Reason—96 pages, 10 cents .
" Behold Your King " —144 pages, maroo n
cloth, 50 cents, twelve for $5 .00 .
Chosen People—64 pages, 10 cents .

DOCTRINAL SUBJECT S
Your Adversary the Devil—32 pages, 5 cents .
The Light of the World—32 pages, 5 cents .
The Church—32 pages, 5 cents .
Born of the Spirit—32 pages, 5 cents .
What Can a Man Believe?—32 pages, 5 cents .
The Blood of Atonement—32 pages, 5 cents .
The Day of Judgment—32 pages, 5 cents .
Divine Healing—32 pages, 5 cents .
Spiritualism—32 pages, 5 cents .
Jesus, the World ' s Savior—32 pages, 5 cents .
Father, Son, Holy Spirit—32 pages, 5 cents .
Does God Answer Prayer?—32 pages, 5 cents .
The Truth About Hell—64 pages, 10 cents .
The Grace of Jehovah—64 pages, 10 cents .
Creation—112 pages, 10 cents .
Hope Beyond the Grave—96 pages, 10 cents .
God ' s Plan—48 pages, 10 cents .
When a Man Dies—48 pages, 10 cents .
Tabernacle Shadows, with questions—16 4
pages, cloth, 50 cents .
The Everlasting Gospel—64 pages, 10 cents .
Hope—16 pages, 25 cents a dozen . Price in-
cludes envelopes to match .

ON THE CHRISTIAN LIF E
Our Most Holy Faith—The "Reprint" book ;
more than 700 pages, cloth, $2 .00 .
Hymns of Dawn—With music, cloth, $1 .00 ;
without music, 25 cents .
Daily Heavenly Manna—cloth, $1 .00 .

IN FOREIGN LANGUAGE S

GERMAN : The Divine Plan of the Ages, 5 0
cents ; The Time Is at Hand, 50 cents ; Taber-
nacle Shadows, 50 cents ; Daily Heavenly
Manna, 50 cents ; "Behold Your King," 5 0
cents ; God and Reason, 10 cents ; Spiritualism ,
10 cents ; When a Man Dies, 10 cents ;
Chosen People, 10 cents ; Our Lord's Return ,
10 cents ; What Can a Man Believe?, 5
cents ; Armageddon, 5 cents ; Hymns of Dawn ,
without music, 25 cents .

ITALIAN : The Divine Plan of the Ages . 50
cents ; Daily Heavenly Manna, 50 cents ; Hym n
Book, cloth $1 .00, flexible 50 cents; Go d
and Reason, 10 cents ; God's Remedy for a
World Gone Mad, 5 cents .

FRENCH : "Behold Your King," 50 cents ;
Daily Heavenly Manna, 50 cents ; God an d
Reason, 10 cents ; God's Plan, 10 cents ;
God's Remedy, 10 cents; Our Lord's Return ,
10 cents ; Jesus, the World's Savior, 10 cents ;
Father, Son, Holy Spirit, 10 cents ; When a
Man Dies, 10 cents .

LITHUANIAN : "Behold Your King," 25 cents ;
Spiritualism, 10 cents .

GREEK : "Behold Your King," 25 cents ;
Hymns of Dawn, without music, 25 cents ; Go d
and Reason, 10 cents .

DANISH : God and Reason, 10 cents; Hope
booklet, 5 cents .

POLISH : The Divine Plan of the Ages, cloth ,
$1 .00, paper 50, cents ; Daily Heavenl y
Manna, $1 .00 ; "Behold Your King," 50 cents ;
God's Kingdom, 10 cen t s .

ROUMANIAN : Where Are the Dead?, 1 0
cents .
HUNGARIAN : What Can a Man Believe?, 5 ct s

HEBREW : God ' s Plan in Brief, 75 cents .

SLOVAK : God's Kingdom; The Day of
Jehovah, 5 cents each .

All 5 cent booklets, 25 for S1 .00 ; 10 cent booklets, 12 for $1 .00 .

DAWN PUBLICATIONS, East Rutherford, N . J . Orders not acknowledged unless requested .



That the church is "the temple of the living God "—
peculiarly "his workmanship " ; that its construction has bee n
in progress throughout the Gospel age—ever since Christ
became the world's Redeemer and the chief corner stone o f
this temple, through which, when finished, God's blessing s
shall come "to all people, " and they find access to him .

—I Cor . 3 :16, 17; Eph . 2 :20-22; Gen . 28 :14 ; Gal . 3 :2 9

That meantime the chiseling, shaping, and polishing o f
consecrated believers in Christ's atonement for sin pro-
gresses, and when the last of these "living stones," "elec t
and precious," shall have been made ready, the grea t
Master Workman will bring all together in the first resur-
rection ; and the temple shall be filled with his glory, an d
be the meeting place between God and men throughou t

the Millennium .—Rev . 15 :5- 8
That the basis of hope for the church and the world lies i n
the fact that "Jesus Christ, by the grace of God taste d

death for every man, " "a ransom for all," and will be "th e
true light which lighteth every man that cometh into th e

world," "in due time."—Heb. 2 :9; John 1 :9 ; I Tim. 2 :5, 6
That the hope of the church is that she may be like he r
Lord, "see him as he is," be a "partaker of the divin e
nature," and share his glory as his joint-heir .—1 John 3 :2;
John 17 :24; Rom . 8 :17 ; II Pet . 1 : 4
That the present mission of the church is the perfectin g
of the saints for the future work of service ; to develop i n
herself every grace ; to be God's witness to the world ; and
to prepare to be the kings and priests in the next age .—
Eph . 4 :12 ; Matt . 24:14; Rev . 1 :6 ; 20 : 6
That the hope for the world lies in the blessings o f
knowledge and opportunity to be brought to all by Christ' s
millennial kingdom—the restitution of all that was lost i n
Adam, to all the willing and obedient, at the hands o f
their Redeemer and his glorified church—when all the wil-
fully wicked will be destroyed .—Acts 3 :19-23 ; Isaiah 35
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